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[bookmark: _Toc131061028][bookmark: _Toc131169247][bookmark: _Toc146788794]EXHIBIT A – CERTIFICATION AND ASSURANCES FORM

BIDDER/APLICANT INFORMATION
	Business Name:   
	

	Name of Authorized Representative:   
	

	Address:   
	

	City:
	
	State:
	
	Zip:
	

	Cell Phone:
	

	Office Phone:
	

	E-mail:
	

	TIN (Tax Identification Number):
Internal Revenue Service
	

	WA UBI (Unified Business Identifier):
WA Department of Licensing
	


ALL IN-STATE BIDDERS/APPLICANTS MUST BE LICENSED TO DO BUSINESS IN WASHINGTON STATE.
OUT-OF-STATE BIDDERS/APPLICANTS SHOULD SEEK GUIDANCE FROM WA DEPARTMENT OF LICENSING FOR SPECIFIC UBI REQUIREMENTS. 

EXECUTIVE STAFF
	List information for each principal officer (President, Vice-President, Treasurer, Chairperson of the Board of Directors, etc.).

	NAME
	TITLE
	ADDRESS
	PHONE NUMBER

	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	


Bidder/Applicant makes the following certifications and assurances as a required element of the bid, quotation, and/or proposal, to which it is attached, understanding that the truthfulness of the facts affirmed here and the continuing compliance with these requirements are conditions precedent to the award or continuation of the related contract(s):
1. UNDERSTANDING. Bidder certifies that Bidder has read, thoroughly examined, and fully understands all of the provisions in the Competitive Application (including all exhibits) and the terms and conditions of the Contract and any amendments or clarifications to the Competitive Application and agrees to abide by the same.
2. ACCURACY. Bidder declares that all answers and statements made in the bid, quotation, and/or proposal are true and correct. 
3. NO COLLUSION OR ANTI-COMPETITIVE PRACTICES. The prices and/or cost data have been determined independently, without consultation, communication, or agreement with others for the purpose of restricting competition. However, Bidder may freely join with other persons or organizations for the purpose of presenting a single bid, quotation, and/or proposal.
4. FIRM OFFER. The attached bid, quotation, and/or proposal is a firm offer for a period of 90 calendar days following receipt, and it may be accepted by the Agency without further negotiation (except where obviously required by lack of certainty in key terms) at any time within the 90-day period.
5. CONFLICT OF INTEREST. In preparing this bid, quotation, and/or proposal, Bidder has not been assisted by any current or former employee of the State of Washington whose duties relate (or did relate) to this bid, quotation, and/or proposal or prospective contract, and who was assisting in other than his or her official, public capacity. (Any exceptions to these assurances are described in full detail on a separate page and attached to this document.)
6. NO REIMBURSEMENT. Bidder understands that the Agency will not issue reimbursement for any costs incurred in the preparation of this bid, quotation, and/or proposal. All bids, quotations and/or proposals become the property of the Agency, and the Bidder claim no proprietary right to the ideas, writings, items, or samples, unless so stated in this bid, quotation, and/or proposal.
7. DISCLOSURE. Unless otherwise required by law, the prices and/or cost data that have been submitted have not been knowingly disclosed by the Bidder and will not knowingly be disclosed by the bidder prior to award, directly or indirectly to any other Bidder or to any competitor.
8. PERFORMANCE. Bidder agrees that submission of bid documents, quotation and/or proposal constitutes acceptance of the Application contents, including all attached or linked terms and conditions. If there are any exceptions to these terms and conditions, the Bidder has described those exceptions in detail on a page attached to Bidder’s submission documents.
9. HARASSMENT. Per RCW 43.01.135, Sexual harassment in the workplace, Agency Contractors/Grantee hereby have access to DNR Policy PO01-052 Sexual Harassment:   
https://www.dnr.wa.gov/publications/em_harassment_prevention_policy.pdf
10. RESTRICTING COMPETITION. No attempt has been made or will be made by the Bidder to persuade any other person or firm to submit or not to submit a bid, quotation, and/or proposal for the purpose of restricting competition.
11. REFERENCES. Bidder grants the Agency the right to contact references and others, who may have pertinent information regarding the Bidder’s prior experience and ability to perform the goods delivered or services rendered contemplated in this procurement.
12. LICENSED IN WASHINGTON STATE. Bidder will become licensed to do business in the State of Washington (if applicable) prior to providing delivered goods or rendered services to DNR. 
13. PREVIOUS STATE EMPLOYEES. If any staff member(s) who will perform work on this contract has retired from the State of Washington under the provisions of the 2008 Early Retirement Factors legislation, list their name(s) on a separately attached page. WAC 415.02.325 RCW 41.50.139
14. DEBARMENT. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐	NO DEBARMENT. Bidder and/or its principals are not presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from contracting with any federal, state, or local governmental entity.
OR
☐	DEBARRED. As detailed on the attached explanation (Bidder to provide), Bidder and/or its principals presently are debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or voluntarily excluded from contracting with a federal, state, or local governmental entity.
15. CRIMINAL OFFENSE. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐	NO CRIMINAL OFFENSE. Bidder and its officers, directors, and managers have not, within the three (3) year period preceding the date of this Competitive Application , been convicted or had a civil judgment rendered against Bidder or such officers, directors, and managers for commission of fraud or a criminal offense in connection with obtaining, attempting to obtain, or performing a governmental contract; violation of any federal or state antitrust statute; or commission of embezzlement, theft, forgery, bribery, falsification or destruction of records, making false statements, or receiving stolen property. Bidder further certifies that Bidder and its officers, directors, and managers are not presently indicted or otherwise criminally or civilly charged by a governmental entity with commission of any of the offenses enumerated in this paragraph.
OR
☐	CRIMINAL OFFENSE. As detailed on the attached explanation (Bidder to provide), within the three (3) year period preceding the date of this Competitive Application , Bidder or its officers, directors, or managers have been convicted or had a civil judgment rendered against Bidder or such officers, directors, or managers for commission of fraud or a criminal offense in connection with obtaining, attempting to obtain, or performing a governmental contract; violation of any federal or state antitrust statute; or commission of embezzlement, theft, forgery, bribery, falsification or destruction of records, making false statements, or receiving stolen property.
16. TERMINATION FOR DEFAULT OR CAUSE. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐	NO TERMINATION FOR DEFAULT OR CAUSE. Bidder has not, within the three (3) year period preceding the date of this Competitive Application , had one (1) or more federal, state, or local governmental contracts terminated for cause or default.
OR
☐	TERMINATION FOR DEFAULT OR CAUSE. As detailed on the attached explanation (Bidder to provide), within the three (3) year period preceding the date of this Competitive Application , Bidder has had one (1) or more federal, state, or local governmental contracts terminated for cause or default.
17. TAXES. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐	TAXES PAID. Except as validly contested, Bidder is not delinquent and has paid or has arranged for payment of all taxes due to the State of Washington and has filed all required returns and reports as applicable.
OR
☐		DELINQUENT TAXES. As detailed on the attached explanation (Bidder to provide), Bidder has not paid or arranged for payment of all taxes due to the State of Washington and/or has not timely filed all required returns and reports as applicable.
18. FINANCIALLY SOLVENT. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐		FINANCIALLY SOLVENT. Bidder is financially stable and solvent, has adequate cash reserves to meet all financial obligations, has not commenced bankruptcy proceedings voluntarily or otherwise, and is not subject to any judgments, liens, or encumbrances of any kind affecting title to any Goods or Services that are the subject of this Competitive Application.
OR
☐	NOT FINANCIALLY SOLVENT. As detailed on the attached explanation (Bidder to provide), Bidder is not financially stable and solvent – i.e., Bidder does not have adequate cash reserves to meet all financial obligations, has commenced bankruptcy proceedings voluntarily or otherwise, or is subject to a judgment, lien, or encumbrance that affects title to the Goods or Services that are the subject of this Competitive Application.
19. LAWFUL REGISTRATION. Bidder, if conducting business other than as a sole proprietorship certifies as follows (must check one):
NOTE: This certification applies only to bidders that are organized as separate legal entities (e.g., a corporation, partnership, Limited Liability Company). If bidder is a sole proprietor, this certification should not be answered.
☐	CURRENT LAWFUL REGISTRATION. Bidder is in good standing in the State of Washington and the jurisdiction where Bidder is organized, including having timely filed all required annual reports.
OR
☐	DELINQUENT REGISTRATION. As detailed on the attached explanation (Bidder to provide), Bidder currently is not in good standing in the State of Washington and/or the jurisdiction where Bidder is organized.
20. REGISTRATION WITH WASHINGTON SECRETARY OF STATE. Bidder, is conducting business other than as a sole proprietorship, certifies as follows (must check one):
NOTE: This certification applies only to bidders that are organized as separate legal entities (e.g., a corporation, partnership, Limited Liability Company). If bidder is a sole proprietor, this certification should not be answered.
☐		BIDDER IS REGISTERED WITH WASHINGTON SECRETARY OF STATE. Bidder is registered with the Washington Secretary of State, is in good standing, and has the following Unified Business Identifier (UBI) number:  ___ ___ ___.
OR
☐		BIDDER WILL REGISTER WITH WASHINGTON SECRETARY OF STATE. Bidder is not registered with the Washington Secretary of State but, if designated as the Apparent Successful Bidder, Bidder will register with the Washington Secretary of State and obtain a UBI number within twenty-four (24) hours of such designation or notification by the Agency or be deemed a nonresponsive bid.
OR
☐		BIDDER IS NOT REGISTERED WITH WASHINGTON SECRETARY OF STATE. Bidder is not registered with the Washington Secretary of State and Bidder declines to register with the Washington Secretary of State. 
21. REGISTRATION WITH WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐		BIDDER IS REGISTERED WITH WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE. Bidder is registered with the Washington State Department of Revenue, has a business license to do business in Washington, and has the following Unified Business Identifier (UBI) number:  ___ ___ ___.
OR
☐		BIDDER WILL REGISTER WITH WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE. Bidder is not registered with the Washington State Department of Revenue but, if designated as the Apparent Successful Bidder, Bidder will register with the Washington State Department of Revenue and obtain a business license within twenty-four (24) hours of such designation or notification by the Agency or be deemed a nonresponsive bid.
OR
☐		BIDDER IS NOT REGISTERED WITH WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF REVENUE. Bidder is not registered with the Washington State Department of Revenue and Bidder declines to register with the Washington State Department of Revenue. 
22. WAGE THEFT PREVENTION. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐		No Wage Violations. This firm has NOT been determined by a final and binding citation and notice of assessment issued by the Washington Department of Labor and Industries or through a civil judgment entered by a court of limited or general jurisdiction to have willfully violated, as defined in RCW 49.48.082, any provision of RCW chapters 49.46, 49.48, or 49.52 within three (3) years prior to the date of the above-referenced procurement Application date.
OR
☐		Violations of Wage Laws. This firm has been determined by a final and binding citation and notice of assessment issued by the Washington Department of Labor and Industries or through a civil judgment entered by a court of limited or general jurisdiction to have willfully violated, as defined in RCW 49.48.082, any provision of RCW chapters 49.46, 49.48, or 49.52 within three (3) years prior to the date of the above-referenced procurement Application date.
23. WORKERS’ RIGHTS (EXECUTIVE ORDER 18-03). Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐		No Mandatory Individual Arbitration Clauses and Class or Collective Action Waivers for Employees. Bidder does NOT require its employees, as a condition of employment, to sign or agree to mandatory individual arbitration clauses or class or collective action waivers.
OR
☐		Mandatory Individual Arbitration Clauses and Class or Collective Action Waivers for Employees. Bidder requires its employees, as a condition of employment, to sign or agree to mandatory individual arbitration clauses or class or collective action waivers.
24. WASHINGTON STATE SUBCONTRACTORS. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐	No Subcontractors. If awarded a Contract, Bidder will not use subcontractors to provide the goods and/or services subject to this Competitive Application.
OR
☐		Yes Subcontractors. If awarded a Contract, Bidder will use subcontractors to provide the goods and/or services subject to this Competitive Application. Bidder must complete in its entirety EXHIBIT C – Sub Contractor inclusion plans per DES POL-DES-090-06 
	In such event, Bidder certifies that, as to the Agency, Bidder shall retain responsibility for its subcontractors, including, without limitation, liability for any subcontractor’s acts or omissions. Note: Bidder must provide the precise legal name (including state of organization), business address, and federal tax identification number (TIN) for each subcontractor. Note: Do not provide any SSN.
25. WASHINGTON STATE CERTIFIED SMALL BUSINESS. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐		Washington Small Business. Bidder is a Washington Small Business as defined in RCW 39.26.010. To qualify as a Washington Small Business, Bidder must meet three (3) requirements:
· Location. Bidder’s principal office/place of business must be located in and identified as being in the State of Washington. A principal office or principal place of business is a firm’s headquarters where business decisions are made and the location for the firm’s books and records as well as the firm’s senior management personnel.
· Size. Bidder must be owned and operated independently from all other businesses and have either: (a) fifty (50) or fewer employees; or (b) gross revenue of less than seven million dollars ($7,000,000) annually as reported on Bidder’s federal income tax return or its return filed with the Washington State Department of Revenue over the previous three consecutive years.
· WEBS Certification. Bidder must have certified its Washington Small Business status in Washington’s Electronic Business Solution (WEBS).
OR
☐	Not Washington Small Business. Bidder is not a Washington Small Business as defined in RCW 39.26.010.
26. WASHINGTON STATE CERTIFIED VETERAN-OWNED BUSINESS. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐	Certified Veteran-Owned Business. Bidder is a Certified Veteran-Owned Business under RCW 43.60A.190. To qualify as a Certified Veteran-Owned Business, Bidder must meet four (4) requirements:
· 51% Ownership. Bidder must be at least fifty-one percent (51%) owned and controlled by:
a. A veteran as defined as every person who at the time he or she seeks certification has received a discharge with an honorable characterization or received a discharge for medical reasons with an honorable record, where applicable, and who has served in at least one of the capacities listed in RCW 41.04.007;
b. A person who is in receipt of disability compensation or pension from the department of veterans affairs; or
c. An active or reserve member in any branch of the armed forces of the United States, including the national guard, coast guard, and armed forces reserves.
· Washington Incorporation/Location. Bidder must be either an entity that is incorporated in the state of Washington as a Washington domestic corporation or, if not incorporated, an entity whose principal place of business is located within the State of Washington.
· WEBS Certification. Bidder must have certified its Veteran-Owned business status in Washington’s Electronic Business Solution (WEBS).
· WDVA Certification. Bidder must have provided certification documentation to the Washington Department of Veterans’ Affairs WDVA and be certified by WDVA and listed as such on WDVA’s website (WDVA – Veteran-Owned Businesses).
OR
☐		Not a Certified Veteran-Owned Business. Bidder is not a Certified Veteran-Owned Business under RCW 43.60A.190.
27. MINORITY AND WOMEN OWNED PARTICIPATION (must check one)
☐	Minority Owned Business 
☐	Women-Owned Business
☐	None of The Above
28. PREFERENCE FOR PCB-FREE PRODUCTS & PRODUCTS-IN-PACKAGING. 
☒		AGENCY HAS DETERMINED THIS PREFERENCE DOES NOT APPLY.
Note: If the above box is checked this preference does not apply. If the box above is not checked complete the following:

Pursuant to RCW 39.26.280, the Washington State Department of Natural Resources is required to provide a preference to a Bidder that provides products and/or product packaging that do not contain Polychlorinated Biphenyls (PCBs). In the event products and/or product packaging are tested, and no products or product packaging contain zero PCBs, a preference of 5% will be given to bidders who provide evidence that the products and/or product packaging, identified above contain the least amount of PCBs. The method for testing products and/or packaging for PCBs must be per the U.S. Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) Analytical Method 1668c. (must check one):
☐		NO BID PREFERENCE. Bidder is not seeking a bid preference for PCB-Free Products & Products-In-Packaging.
OR
☐		BID PREFERENCE FOR ALL PRODUCTS & PRODUCTS-IN-PACKAGING. Bidder is seeking a bid preference for all of Bidder’s products pertaining to the above referenced Competitive Application . Bidder certifies that each and all of Bidder’s products identified in the above referenced Competitive Application have been tested, within the previous 365 days, by an independent, third party laboratory using Environmental Protection Agency Analytical Method 1668c, and have been found NOT to contain PCBs. Bidder further certifies that the attached test results are the official test results for such products.
OR
☐		BID PREFERENCE FOR SPECIFIC PRODUCTS & PRODUCTS-IN-PACKAGING. Bidder IS seeking a bid preference for Bidder’s following specific product(s) pertaining to the above referenced Competitive Application . Bidder certifies that each of Bidder’s listed product(s) pertaining to the above referenced Competitive Application have been  tested, within the previous 365 days, by an independent, third party laboratory using Environmental Protection Agency Analytical Method 1668c, and have been found NOT to contain PCBs. Bidder further certifies that the attached test results are the official test results for such product(s).
29. PREFERENCE FOR ELECTRONIC PRODUCTS
☒		AGENCY HAS DETERMINED THIS PREFERENCE DOES NOT APPLY.
Note: If the above box is checked this preference does not apply. If the box above is not checked complete the following:
Pursuant to RCW 39.26.265, the Agency is required to provide a preference to a Bidder that provides electronic products that have achieved EPEAT Silver or Gold registration.

Bidders who seek to obtain the bid preference for electronic products must certify that the products identified have achieved EPEAT Silver or Gold registration. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐			NO BID PREFERENCE. Bidder is not seeking a bid preference for Electronic Products
OR
☐			BID PREFERENCE FOR ALL PRODUCTS Bidder is seeking a bid preference for all of Bidder’s products pertaining to the above referenced Application. Bidder certifies all product(s) identified above have achieved EPEAT Silver or Gold registration. Documentation to support the EPEAT registration for each applicable product is attached to this certification.
30. PREFERENCE FOR NON-HYDROFLUOROCARBONS (HFCS)
☒			AGENCY HAS DETERMINED THIS PREFERENCE DOES NOT APPLY.
Note: If the above box is checked this preference does not apply. If the box above is not checked complete the following:
Pursuant to RCW 39.26.310, the Agency is required to provide a preference to a Bidder that provides products that contain NO HFCs or contain HFCs with a comparatively low global warming potential. The products that will be eligible for a preference are all products with an “Acceptable” Substitute Listing Status, as identified by the Environmental Protection Agency’s (EPA) Significant New Alternatives Policy (SNAP) Program. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐		NO BID PREFERENCE. Bidder is not seeking a bid preference for Electronic Products
OR
☐	BID PREFERENCE FOR ALL PRODUCTS Bidder is seeking a bid preference for all of Bidder’s products pertaining to the above referenced Application. Bidder certifies all product(s) identified above have an “Acceptable” Substitute Listing Status as identified by the EPA SNAP Program. Documentation to support the “Acceptable” Substitute Listing status for each applicable product is attached to this certification.

31. PREFERENCE FOR NON-MERCURY ADDED PRODUCTS
☒			AGENCY HAS DETERMINED THIS PREFERENCE DOES NOT APPLY.
Note: If the above box is checked this preference does not apply. If the box above is not checked complete the following:
Pursuant to RCW 70.95M.060, the Agency is required to provide a preference to a Bidder that provides products that contain the least amount of mercury-added compounds or components or if the product containing mercury is designed to reduce electricity consumption by at least forty percent and there is no non-mercury or lower mercury alternative available that saves the same or a greater amount of electricity as the exempted product. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐		NO BID PREFERENCE. Bidder is not seeking a bid preference for Non-Mercury Added Products
OR
☐	BID PREFERENCE FOR ALL PRODUCTS Bidder is seeking a bid preference for all of Bidder’s products pertaining to the above referenced Application. Bidder certifies all product(s) identified above listed above that are eligible for the preference, and as contained in the Interstate Mercury Education and Reduction Clearinghouse Mercury-Added Products Database. Documentation to support the preference is attached to this certification.
32. PREFERENCE FOR RECYCLED CONTENT PRODUCTS
☒			AGENCY HAS DETERMINED THIS PREFERENCE DOES NOT APPLY.
Note: If the above box is checked this preference does not apply. If the box above is not checked complete the following:
Pursuant to RCW 39.26.255, the Agency is required to provide a preference to a Bidder that provides products that contain recycled material. All bidders must certify whether they are seeking the statutory preference for products containing recycled material.
Bidders who seek to obtain the preference for Products Containing Recycled Material must certify that the products identified in above exceed the minimum required amount(s) of post-consumer or total recycled material described in the relevant section of the Environmental Protection Agency’s Comprehensive Procurement Guideline Program. Bidder certifies as follows (must check one):
☐	NO BID PREFERENCE. Bidder is not seeking a bid preference for Recycled Content Products
OR
☐		BID PREFERENCE FOR ALL PRODUCTS Bidder is seeking a bid preference for all of Bidder’s products pertaining to the above referenced Application. Bidder certifies all product(s) identified above listed above exceed the Environmental Protection Agency’s Comprehensive Procurement Guidelines standard (as it existed on July 1, 2001) recommended content level percentages or the minimum product specification. The recycled material levels of all product(s) eligible for the preference are attached to this certification.

I hereby certify, under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of Washington, that I am authorized to make these certifications and assurances on behalf of the firm listed herein.
	


	PRINT FULL LEGAL ENTITY NAME OF FIRM SUBMITTING BID, QUOTATION, AND/OR PROPOSAL



	SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED PERSON                                                       DATE SIGNED

	

	

	PRINTED NAME OF PERSON MAKING CERTIFICATION FOR FIRM

	


	TITLE OF PERSON SIGNING CERTIFICATE



	PRINT COUNTY AND STATE WHERE SIGNED



RETURN FORM TO:  APPLICATION COORDINATOR WITH YOUR BID, QUOTATION, AND/OR PROPOSAL AS INDICATED WITHIN.

[bookmark: _Toc146788795]EXHIBIT B – MANAGEMENT PROPOSAL FORM
Items marked “mandatory” must be included as part of the bid, quotation, and/or proposal to be considered responsive; however, these items are not scored. Items marked “scored” are those that are awarded points as part of the evaluation conducted by the evaluation team.

	A. PROJECT MANAGEMENT (SCORED)

	A1. PROJECT TEAM STRUCTURE/INTERNAL CONTROLS  (SCORED)
All Bidders/Applicants are REQUIRED to provide a description of the proposed project team structure and internal controls to be used during the course of this project, including any Subcontractors. Include who will provide invoices and other contract administration duties. Include who within the business will have prime responsibility and final authority for the work.

	

	A2. STAFF QUALIFICATIONS/EXPERIENCE (SCORED)
All Bidders/Applicants are REQUIRED to identify staff, including Subcontractors, who will be assigned to the potential contract. Indicate responsibilities and qualifications of each staff member and include the amount of time each will be assigned to the project. Resumes are not required as indicated in Section 3.2 Bidder/Applicant Checklist. Any staff substitution MUST have the prior approval of the Agency.

	STAFF NAME
	RESPONSIBILITIES & QUALIFICATIONS
	ESTIMATED TIME ON PROJECT

	
	
	

	
	
	

	
	
	

	A3. SCHEDULE 
All Bidders/Applicants are REQUIRED to provide a written work plan for how the Scope of Work will be completed. Include estimated timelines, crews, and/or equipment used, and how the firm will deal with unanticipated disruptions to the schedule. This schedule should be described in detail in EXHIBIT F – Project Proposal.

	

	B. EXPERIENCE 

	B1. KNOWLEDGE, SKILLS, AND ABILITIES – REQUIRED (PASS/FAIL)
All Bidders/Applicants are REQUIRED to check each box verifying that their experience meets the required knowledge, skill, or ability identified.

	CHECK FOR VERIFICATION
	REQUIRED KNOWLEDGE, SKILLS, AND ABILITIES

	☐	Bidder/Applicant has all the required knowledge, skills, and abilities to successfully complete their proposed project within the given time frame. 

	B2. EXPERIENCE OF THE BIDDER/APPLICANT (SCORED)
Describe in detail the experience the Bidder/Applicant and any Subcontractors have in projects similar to the project proposed herein.

	
	

	
	

	C. RELATED INFORMATION (MANDATORY)

	C1. TERMINATION FOR DEFAULT (PASS/FAIL)
HAS THE BIDDER/APPLICANT OR SUBCONTRACTOR HAD A CONTRACT TERMINATED FOR DEFAULT IN THE LAST FIVE (5) YEARS? 
	☐  Yes
	☐  No

	Termination for default is defined as notice to stop work due to the Bidder’s/Applicant’s non-performance or poor performance and the issue of performance was either a) not litigated due to inaction on the part of the Bidder/Applicant or b) litigated and such litigation determined that the Bidder/Applicant was in default.

	If the Bidder/Applicant answered yes above, describe the incident. Submit full details of the terms of default including the other party’s name, address, and phone number. Present the Bidder’s/Applicant’s position on the matter. The Agency will evaluate the facts and may, at its sole discretion, reject the bid, quotation, and/or proposal on the grounds of past experience.

	

	C2. CURRENT/FORMER STATE EMPLOYEE (PASS/FAIL)
Identify any current or former state employees employed by the state in the past 24 months, currently employed by or on the governing board of the firm or any Subcontractor as of the date of the date of bid, quotation, and/or proposal submittal. Include their position and responsibilities within the Bidder’s/Applicant’s or Subcontractor’s organization. If following a review of this information, it is determined by the Agency that a conflict of interest exists, the Bidder/Applicant may be disqualified from further consideration for the award of a contract.

	CURRENT/FORMER STATE EMPLOYEE NAME:   
	

	AGENCY WHERE CURRENTLY/FORMERLY EMPLOYED:
	

	POSITION HELD:
	

	SEPARATION DATE:
	

	POSITION WITHIN BIDDERS FIRM:   
	

	RESPONSIBILITY WITHIN BIDDERS FIRM:   
	

	D. REFERENCES (SCORED)
Demonstrating reliability, customer service, conflict resolution.
Provide at least 1 reference. By submitting a bid, quotation, and/or proposal, the Bidder/Applicant grants permission to the Agency to contact these references and others, who from the Agency’s perspective, may have pertinent information. Current Agency staff CAN be used as references.

	BUSINESS REFERENCE NAME:   
	

	NAME OF AUTHORIZED CONTACT:   
	

	ADDRESS:   
	

	CITY:
	
	STATE:
	
	ZIP:
	

	CELL PHONE:
	

	OFFICE PHONE:
	

	E-MAIL:
	

	TIME FRAME OF SERVICES PROVIDED:
	

	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES PERFORMED:
	

	

	BUSINESS REFERENCE NAME:   
	

	NAME OF AUTHORIZED CONTACT:   
	

	ADDRESS:   
	

	CITY:
	
	STATE:
	
	ZIP:
	

	CELL PHONE:
	

	OFFICE PHONE:
	

	E-MAIL:
	

	TIME FRAME OF SERVICES PROVIDED:
	

	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES PERFORMED:
	

	

	BUSINESS REFERENCE NAME:   
	

	NAME OF AUTHORIZED CONTACT:   
	

	ADDRESS:   
	

	CITY:
	
	STATE:
	
	ZIP:
	

	CELL PHONE:
	

	OFFICE PHONE:
	

	E-MAIL:
	

	TIME FRAME OF SERVICES PROVIDED:
	

	DESCRIPTION OF SERVICES PERFORMED:
	





		SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED PERSON 			DATE SIGNED

RETURN FORM TO:  APPLICATION COORDINATOR WITH YOUR BID, QUOTATION, AND/OR PROPOSAL AS INDICATED WITHIN.

[bookmark: _Toc131061030][bookmark: _Toc131169249][bookmark: _Toc146788796]EXHIBIT C – DIVERSE BUSINESS INCLUSION PLAN – SUBCONTRATORS

INFORMATION & INSTRUCTIONS FOR COMPLETING EXHIBIT C DIVERSE BUSINESS INCLUSION PLAN – SUBCONTRACTORS
1. Bidders who, if awarded a Contract, intend to use subcontractors, must complete Exhibit C – Diverse Business Inclusion Plan – Subcontractors in the form set forth herein. Awarded bidders who do not submit a Diverse Business Inclusion Plan will be precluded from utilizing subcontractors to perform the Contract.
Note:  Exhibit C – Diverse Business Inclusion Plan – Subcontractors is NOT required if bidder, if awarded, does NOT intend to use subcontractors for this contract.
2. As part of the Diverse Business Inclusion Plan – Subcontractors, bidder is encouraged to include an anticipated list of small/diverse subcontractors who may assist bidder in fulfilling bidder’s contractual obligations, if bidder is awarded a contract pursuant to this Competitive Application. This list should identify any subcontractors who are small/diverse businesses as defined above.
Note:  The businesses included in the Diverse Business Inclusion Plan – Subcontractors are listed as examples of the businesses that bidder may use as subcontractors and does NOT obligate bidder to utilize those specific businesses in performing the Contract, if awarded. If awarded, the bidder’s Diverse Business Inclusion Plan – Subcontractor will be incorporated into the terms and conditions of the resulting Contract and bidder will report performance and progress to the Agency as set forth in the Contract and in annual contract management meetings.
3. Bidders must describe their efforts in engaging and reducing any barriers to participation by small/diverse businesses, including outreach, education/mentorship, and process changes designed to increase small/diverse business participation.
4. If the proposed subcontractors are self-identified diverse businesses, bidder will encourage and support efforts for their certification with the appropriate Washington state agencies.
5. The small/diverse business goals set forth herein are voluntary. Bidders will not be considered non-responsive if the Diverse Business Inclusion Plan – Subcontractors has a zero small/diverse business participation amount. The Agency, however, encourages bidders to be proactive in engaging small/diverse business participation. No preference will be included in the evaluation of bids based on the Diverse Business Inclusion Plan – Subcontractors. No minimum level of small/diverse business participation is required as a condition for receiving a Contract award.
6. The Agency will review the Diverse Business Inclusion Plan – Subcontractors for a genuine effort and the maximum opportunity to contribute toward the Agency’s aspirational goals. Awarded bidders who utilize subcontractors will meet with the Agency annually regarding their small/diverse business aspirational inclusion goals and outreach efforts set forth in their Diverse Business Inclusion Plan – Subcontractors.


	1. BIDDER’S ANTICIPATED DIVERSE BUSINESS PARTICIPATION (GOALS) 
List bidder’s anticipated small/diverse business category participation goals for subcontractor participation, if bidder is awarded a Contract. Bidders may list any goal amount. These goals are aspirational goals for bidder’s use of small/diverse business subcontractors, if awarded a Contract pursuant to this Competitive Application.

	SMALL/DIVERSE BUSINESS CATEGORY
	AGENCY GOALS*
	ANTICIPATED PERCENT OF CONTRACT AMOUNT (GOALS)

	Minority-Owned Business
	5%
	

	Woman-Owned Business
	5%
	

	Veteran-Owned Business
	1%
	

	Washington Small Business
	10%
	

	2. BIDDER’S DIVERSE BUSINESS SUBCONTRACTING LIST 
Provide the firm information of the relevant small/diverse business subcontractors that bidder anticipates utilizing, if awarded a contract pursuant to this Competitive Application . Please identify the names of the firms as they are listed in Washington’s Electronic Business Solution (WEBS) and provide the firm’s applicable certification numbers (for Minority, Woman, and Veteran-Owned firms).

	STATE CERTIFICATION CATEGORY
	LIST OF FIRMS

	Minority-Owned Businesses
	

	Woman-Owned Businesses
	

	Veteran-Owned Businesses
	

	Washington Small Businesses
	

	3. DESCRIBE BIDDER’S PLAN TO MEET OR EXCEED BIDDER’S VOLUNTARY DIVERSE BUSINESS INCLUSION PLAN – SUBCONTRACTORS GOALS, INCLUDING OUTREACH. IF MORE SPACE IS NEEDED, PLEASE ATTACH ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS.

	

	4. IDENTIFY BIDDER’S PRIMARY CONTACT FOR BIDDER’S DIVERSE BUSINESS INCLUSION PLAN – SUBCONTRACTORS GOALS. IF MORE SPACE IS NEEDED, PLEASE ATTACH ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS.

	


*Agency diversity goals are based on FY22 OMWBE reporting results and will be updated after the DES Diversity policy requirements have been analyzed. 

Bidder commits to a make a genuine effort to achieve the proposed subcontract amounts with small/diverse business subcontractors as stated above. Bidder will develop a comprehensive outreach strategy that will engage small/diverse businesses registered with the State of Washington in WEBS.

	

	PRINT FULL LEGAL ENTITY NAME OF FIRM SUBMITTING BID, QUOTATION, AND/OR PROPOSAL



	SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED PERSON                                                       DATE SIGNED

	

	

	PRINTED NAME OF PERSON MAKING CERTIFICATION FOR FIRM

	


	TITLE OF PERSON SIGNING CERTIFICATE



	PRINT COUNTY AND STATE WHERE SIGNED



RETURN FORM TO:  APPLICATION COORDINATOR WITH YOUR BID, QUOTATION, AND/OR PROPOSAL AS INDICATED WITHIN
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EXHIBIT F – PROJECT PROPOSAL FORM
[image: Text

Description automatically generated]
2024 Washington Community Forestry Assistance Grant 
[bookmark: Application_Form]
Section I — PROPOSAL SUMMARY
Complete all fields and provide a signature. Applicants will also be required to enter the information from Section I in the on-line submission form.
Name of Proposed Project (not to exceed 5 words): Enter text. 
Location (City): Enter text.
Project GIS Coordinates (reference point): Latitude, - Longitude

Address and Contact Information for the Organization Applying for the Grant
Applicant Name: Enter text.
Organization UBI Number: Enter text. 
Employer Identification Number: Enter text.
Mailing Address: Enter text.

City: Enter Text.  State: Enter Text.  Zip Code: Enter Text.  

Applicant Contact Person: Enter text.  E-mail Address: Enter text.
Title/Role with Organization: Enter text. Phone number: Enter text. 
Score of project location according to the Washington Environmental Health Disparities Map: Enter Score.
Project location is identified disadvantaged according to the Climate and Economic Justice Screening Tool: ☐ Y    ☐ N

Tree Equity Score (if applicable): Enter Score.
Brief Summary of the project (not to exceed 3 lines of text):

Enter text.
Budget Summary (Summarize total amounts from the budget worksheet. Round to the nearest dollar.)
Grant funds requested	              	$ Enter Amount.
Matching funds provided (not required)	$ Enter Amount.
Funding requested (based on Grant funds requested):
☐ $10,000 - $49,999 ☐ $50,000 - $199,999 ☐ $200,000 - $350,000



By signing this form, the undersigned agrees all information is accurate to the best of their knowledge.
___________________________________________________________________________
Name and Title of Authorized Representative	Date

 ___________________________________________________________________________
Signature of Authorized Representative	Date

Section II — PROPOSAL NARRATIVE
Applicants must address each item within the length described. Text must be Arial, size 9, and single spaced.

1. PROJECT DESCRIPTION (not to exceed 2 pages in length)
	
Describe the purpose, scope, and timeline of your project, as well as the location and community setting. Include details on roles and responsibilities of partners and projects participants; how the project addresses urban and community forest management; and, identify the benefits of the project for promoting equity and environmental justice within the community.
































2. ACTIVITIES (not to exceed 2 pages in length)
Project activities are the work for which the applicant is requesting funding. Tasks are the major steps required to complete the activity. Deliverables are the results of the tasks or activities and are provided to DNR as evidence of completion. Provide a bulleted list of project tasks and break out each one into associated deliverables.
· Activity 1:
· Task 1.1:
· Deliverable 1.1(a):
· Task 1.2:
· Deliverable 1.2(a):
· Etc.

· Activity 2:
· Task 2.1:
· Deliverable 2.1(a):
· Task 2.2: 
· Deliverable 2.2(a):
· Etc.

· Activity 3:
· Task 3.1:
· Deliverable 3.1(a):
· Task 3.2:
· Deliverable 3.2(a):
· Etc.




3. OTHER OUTCOMES/PROJECT CONTEXT (not to exceed one page in length)
Describe other project outcomes or components unique to the project that may add value or context. Examples could be, but are not limited to: innovative methods such as new technology or techniques; partnerships or cooperative ventures important to the success of the project; addressing environmental justice and health disparity issues; history of involvement with community; description of how residents are part of the project’s decision-making process; community involvement in stewardship or advocacy activities.








Section III — PROPOSAL BUDGET WORKSHEET and SAMPLE BUDGET 
☐ I, applicant, am submitting a project budget as a separate document in lieu of this template, see section 3.4 of the RFA for details. (Budget sheet is not to exceed 2 pages in length)
Name of Proposed Project:  ____________________________________________
Applicant/Organization Name: __________________________________________.

	EXPENSE
	Grant Funds* 
	Applicant Match
	In-Kind Match
	Non-Applicant Cash Match
	TOTAL PER EXPENSE

	Activity 1

	Task 1.1

	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Task 1.2

	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Task 1.3

	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Activity 2

	Task 2.1

	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Task 2.2

	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	Task 2.3

	
	
	
	
	
	

	
	
	
	
	
	

	TOTAL PER FUND CATEGORY
	
	
	
	
	



* Only grant funds are scored. Matching funds are not required but should be included if applicable.

SAMPLE BUDGET

Project Name __Inventory and Management Plan______________

Applicant Organization ____City of Forestree________________


In this example, the City of Forestree is applying for a 2024 Community Forestry Assistance Grant to do an urban forestry inventory and management plan. They plan to conduct an inventory with support from a contractor, in-house staff and help from a volunteer group. They plan to contract with a consultant to analyze data and write the management plan.

The inventory, data analysis, and management plan components are separated in this sample budget. In addition, each component is broken down into line item tasks that clearly show the associated costs, and how the Applicant expects to account for those costs.

	EXPENSE
	Grant Funds*
	Applicant Match
	In-Kind Match
	Non-Applicant Cash Match
	TOTAL PER EXPENSE

	Activity 1: Tree Inventory

	Task 1.1 Data Collection

	Consultant collects data
Deliverable 1.1(a): completed plan
	$10,000
	
	
	
	$10,000

	Staff collect data and supervise volunteers
	
	$6,000
	
	
	$6,000

	Volunteers collect data
15 @ $37.63/hr * 28 total hours
	
	
	$15,805
	
	$15,805

	Task 1.2 Purchase tree inventory software

	“Brand Name” inventory software
Deliverable 1.2(a): proof of purchase
	$1,000
	$1,000
	
	
	$2,000

	Task 1.3 Training for volunteers

	Four 1-hour training sessions
	$1,000
	$2,000
	$2,000
	
	$5,000

	Activity 2: Data Analysis 

	Task 2.1

	Consultant to analyze data
Deliverable 2: results of analysis
	$6,000
	
	
	
	$6,000

	Activity 3: Management Plan

	Consultant writes and submits plan
Deliverable 3(a): completed plan
	$7,000
	
	
	
	$7,000

	Printing (Generous benefactor) – 1,000 copies
	
	
	
	$1,000
	$1,000

	TOTAL PER FUND CATEGORY
	$25,000
	$9,000
	$17,805
	$1,000
	$52,805



* Only grant funds are scored. Matching funds are not required but should be included if applicable.
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