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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 

 July 2020 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 99052 GLINDA THE  Grays Harbor SP 6913 $1,895,000.00 $2,551,100.00 $369.03 35% 4.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 GOOD 

 100010 Q PETTIJOHN Okanogan NE 2340 $272,000.00 $531,901.53 $227.31 96% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 100023 FRANCES 40 SORTS Pacific PC 240 $49,245.72 $70,053.82 $291.89 42% 1.33 See Sort Sales Results 

 98542 DAY LAKE  Skagit NW 9389 $1,428,000.00 $3,841,394.00 $409.14 169% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 OVERLOOK VRH  
 WMZ 

 98253 Q KINGS SORTS Stevens NE 3393 $330,707.87 $429,055.87 $126.45 30% 2.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 100463 Q THONI ROAD Stevens NE 2871 $530,000.00 $613,005.95 $213.52 16% 3.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 95392 BELLWETHER VRH Whatcom NW 5183 $967,000.00 $2,465,398.00 $475.67 155% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
  RMZ WMZ 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2020 7 7 0 0 30,329 30,246 0 83 100% $5,452,722.59 $10,501,909.17 $347.22 93% 2.48 
YTD FY 2021 7 7 0 0 30,329 30,246 0 83 100% $5,452,722.59 $10,501,909.17 $347.22 93% 2.48   

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100692 POWERLINE ALDER Clallam OLY 246 $35,000.00 NO BIDS 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2020 1 0 0 1 246 0 0 246 0% $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0% 
YTD FY 2021 1 0 0 1 246 0 0 246 0% $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 0%   

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2020 8 7 0 1 30,575 30,246 0 329 99% $5,452,722.59 $10,501,909.17 $347.22 93% 2.48 
YTD FY 2021 8 7 0 1 30,575 30,246 0 329 99% $5,452,722.59 $10,501,909.17 $347.22 93% 2.48 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

 July 2020 

 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100363 FRANCES 40 SORT 12 122 $515.00 $637.50 $27,965.20 $42,910.20 $351.72 2 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 100364 FRANCES 40 SORT 13 105 $450.00 $479.42 $15,433.21 $18,522.31 $176.40 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 100365 FRANCES 40 SORT 14 9 $750.00 $1,220.00 $4,391.31 $8,621.31 $957.92 1 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 100366 FRANCES 40 SORT 15 4 $364.00 $1,456.00 0 NO BIDS 
 100767 Q KINGS SORT 01 705 $402.00 $468.00 $87,862.13 $134,392.13 $190.63 3 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100768 Q KINGS SORT 02 746 $400.00 $445.00 $113,695.72 $147,265.72 $197.41 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 

 100769 Q KINGS SORT 03 148 $359.36 $378.36 $10,933.92 $13,745.92 $92.88 2 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100770 Q KINGS SORT 04 178 $328.46 $328.46 $11,522.99 $11,522.99 $64.74 1 IFG Timber, LLC 
 100771 Q KINGS SORT 05 415 $307.45 $352.56 ($8,720.83) $9,998.17 $24.09 3 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 

 100772 Q KINGS SORT 06 511 $340.94 $341.06 $38,361.17 $38,423.17 $75.19 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 

 100773 Q KINGS SORT 07 84 $792.86 $964.64 $45,249.60 $59,679.60 $710.47 2 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 100774 Q KINGS SORT 08 527 $320.02 $320.02 $14,028.17 $14,028.17 $26.62 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100775 Q KINGS SORT 09 79 $225.00 $17,775.00 0 NO BIDS 


