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 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 January 2020 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 97259 CLAUDE SUMMIT Clallam OLY 7504 $1,034,000.00 $1,047,274.17 $139.56 1% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 99246 JOHNNY'S SHACK Clallam OLY 4315 $771,000.00 $949,267.15 $219.99 23% 4.00 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 99295 AMICABLE VRH Cowlitz, PC 6230 $1,717,000.00 $1,970,744.62 $316.33 15% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
   Wahkiakum 
 99095 DRAG Grays Harbor PC 4864 $1,488,000.00 $1,794,236.00 $368.88 21% 4.00 Western Forest Products 
 95702 * TAILINGS Kitsap SP 3603 $863,000.00 $1,127,606.81 $312.96 31% 2.00 Murphy Company 
 93163 * PLEASANT  Lewis SP 2670 $732,000.00 $807,425.04 $302.41 10% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 VALLEY 
 97340 WHIP N SPUR Lewis PC 2891 $917,000.00 $1,201,200.00 $415.50 31% 4.00 Western Forest Products 
 98030 HEARTBREAK  Lewis PC 4153 $1,389,000.00 $2,103,086.00 $506.40 51% 5.00 Western Timber, Inc. 
 RIDGE VRH RMZ 
 99274 MUD DUCK SORTS Lewis PC 5928 $2,231,428.17 $2,618,077.23 $441.65 17% 3.00 See Sort Sales Results 

 99256 CINCH Mason SP 1296 $439,000.00 $520,313.65 $401.48 19% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 99119 TRAPPER KEEPPER Pacific PC 2409 $594,000.00 $910,712.61 $378.05 53% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 

 98731 PUFFIN VRH WMZ  Skagit, Snohomish NW 4322 $981,000.00 $1,803,922.00 $417.38 84% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 RMZ 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2020 12 12 0 0 50,185 50,185 0 0 100% $13,156,428.17 $16,853,865.28 $335.83 28% 3.00 
YTD FY 2020 67 59 0 8 288,721 257,845 0 30,876 90% $58,902,590.73 $77,782,865.34 $301.67 32% 2.60 

  REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 
 January 2020 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 99547 SALT & SAND Clallam OLY 521 $173,000.00 $225,779.16 $433.36 31% 6.00 Murphy Company 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2020 1 1 0 0 521 521 0 0 100% $173,000.00 $225,779.16 $433.36 31% 6.00 
YTD FY 2020 3 3 0 0 2,630 2,630 0 0 100% $526,000.00 $739,846.54 $281.31 41% 3.00 
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 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

January 2020 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2020 13 13 0 0 50,706 50,706 0 0 100% $13,329,428.17 $17,079,644.44 $336.84 28% 3.23 
YTD FY 2020 70 62 0 8 291,351 260,475 0 30,876 90% $59,428,590.73 $78,522,711.88 $301.46 32% 2.62 

  
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 99702 MUD DUCK SORT 1 773 $600.00 $628.21 $336,251.62 $358,057.95 $463.21 4 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 99703 MUD DUCK SORT 2 1,368 $620.00 $711.79 $528,794.42 $654,363.14 $478.34 3 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 99704 MUD DUCK SORT 3 1,328 $675.00 $691.75 $658,456.44 $680,700.44 $512.58 4 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 99705 MUD DUCK SORT 4 703 $450.00 $547.82 $187,522.18 $256,289.64 $364.57 3 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 99706 MUD DUCK SORT 5 1,053 $460.00 $523.35 $305,228.51 $371,936.06 $353.22 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 99707 MUD DUCK SORT 6 202 $396.91 $534.42 $43,854.52 $71,631.52 $354.61 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 99709 MUD DUCK SORT 8 193 $950.00 $1,101.00 $153,304.85 $182,447.85 $945.33 2 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 99710 MUD DUCK SORT 9 47 $390.00 $481.00 $3,173.70 $7,450.70 $158.53 3 MTS Enterprises 
 99711 MUD DUCK SORT 10 261 $338.00 $416.00 $14,841.93 $35,199.93 $134.87 4 Cascade Hardwood, LLC 


