

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

**August 2021**

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
101765		SWITCHED SIGNAL SORTS	Cowlitz	PC	5631	\$1,315,205.73	\$1,495,240.58	\$265.54	14%	1.75	See Sort Sales Results
100670	*	HATCHET	Lewis	SP	4430	\$1,756,000.00	\$1,986,547.02	\$448.43	13%	1.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101494		CARRY A TUNE	Lewis	PC	3601	\$1,293,000.00	\$2,165,034.60	\$601.23	67%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101630		Q HARVARD	Okanogan	NE	4694	\$883,000.00					NO BIDS
101610		Q FIRECRACKER	Pend Oreille	NE	5985	\$2,490,000.00					NO BIDS
100424		CECIL VDT	Skagit	NW	4289	\$1,068,000.00	\$1,422,173.16	\$331.59	33%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
101651		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORTS	Wahkiakum	PC	24	\$9,508.03	\$9,508.03	\$396.17	0%	1.00	See Sort Sales Results

**SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>August 2021</b>	7	5	0	2	28,654	17,512	0	11,142	63%	\$5,117,613.76	\$7,078,503.39	\$404.21	38%	1.55
<b>YTD FY 2022</b>	14	10	0	4	53,760	39,641	0	14,119	75%	\$14,278,206.91	\$18,712,331.46	\$472.04	31%	2.12

**REGIONAL SALE RESULTS**

**August 2021**

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
101951		ROSY OWL-CLOVER	Yakima	SE	1058	\$106,000.00	\$113,190.75	\$106.99	7%	1.00	Mountain Logging, Inc

**SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>August 2021</b>	1	1	0	0	1,058	1,058	0	0	100%	\$106,000.00	\$113,190.75	\$106.99	7%	1.00
<b>YTD FY 2022</b>	1	1	0	0	1,058	1,058	0	0	100%	\$106,000.00	\$113,190.75	\$106.99	7%	1.00

**SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>August 2021</b>	8	6	0	2	29,712	18,570	0	11,142	64%	\$5,223,613.76	\$7,191,694.14	\$387.27	38%	1.46
<b>YTD FY 2022</b>	15	11	0	4	54,818	40,699	0	14,119	75%	\$14,384,206.91	\$18,825,522.21	\$462.55	31%	2.03

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

\* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

August 2021

Delivered Values

Stumpage Determination (Projected)

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)			# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
				MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF		
101745		ELOCHOMOTIVE SORT 7 RA 5"+	24	\$600.00	\$600.00	\$9,508.03	\$9,508.03	\$396.17	1	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
101766		SWITCHED SIGNAL SORT 1 DF 5"-11"	1,077	\$650.00	\$707.24	\$289,724.58	\$351,372.06	\$326.25	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101767		SWITCHED SIGNAL SORT 2 DF 12"+	551	\$675.00	\$675.00	\$165,785.29	\$165,785.29	\$300.88	1	Sierra Pacific Industries
101768		SWITCHED SIGNAL SORT 3 DF HQ 12"+	463	\$700.00		\$324,100.00			0	NO BIDS
101769		SWITCHED SIGNAL SORT 4 WW 5"-11"	1,558	\$525.00	\$659.27	\$226,627.84	\$435,820.50	\$279.73	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101770		SWITCHED SIGNAL SORT 5 WW 12"+	1,748	\$550.00	\$658.89	\$323,958.15	\$514,297.87	\$294.22	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
101771		SWITCHED SIGNAL SORT 6 RA 5"+	21	\$625.00	\$625.00	\$6,489.65	\$6,489.65	\$309.03	1	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
101772		SWITCHED SIGNAL SORT 7 DF/TF Pulp 2"+	149	\$286.00	\$508.56	(\$18,681.51)	\$14,479.93	\$97.18	2	Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC
101773		SWITCHED SIGNAL SORT 8 WH Pulp 2"+	55	\$364.00	\$508.56	(\$2,605.86)	\$5,344.94	\$97.18	2	Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC
101774		SWITCHED SIGNAL SORT 9 Hardwood Pulp 2"+	9	\$390.00	\$594.75	(\$192.41)	\$1,650.34	\$183.37	2	Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

\* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)