

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES**

**JANUARY 2025 AUCTION RESULTS**

**BOARD SALE RESULTS**

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
105915		DUNGENESS AND DRAGONS	Clallam	OLY	1224	\$311,000.00	\$481,500.00	\$393.38	55%	2.00	Bekkevar Logging and Trucking Inc.
106156		DABBLER	Clark	PC	8621	\$2,909,000.00	\$5,188,434.00	\$601.84	78%	5.00	Stimson Lumber Company, Inc.
107101		TWEEDY	Grays Harbor	PC	5268	\$1,367,000.00	\$1,830,443.00	\$347.46	34%	5.00	Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
104810		FISH AND CHIPS	Jefferson	OLY	8879	\$1,621,556.00	\$2,255,776.90	\$254.06	39%	3.00	Harbor Timber
106773		MALADJUSTED	Jefferson	OLY	3097	\$881,000.00	\$1,393,412.17	\$449.92	58%	4.00	Murphy Company
107171		NEW FOX	Jefferson	OLY	10745	\$1,784,498.00	\$3,267,452.00	\$304.09	83%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
107867		LAST CROCKER RESALE SORTS	Jefferson	OLY	5447	\$1,549,226.34	\$2,551,059.13	\$468.34	65%	2.91	See Sort Sales Results
104155		FIVE DOLLAR BILL	Lewis	PC	4494	\$1,563,000.00	\$2,530,097.85	\$562.99	62%	6.00	Murphy Company
105259		SERENDIPITY	Mason	SPS	2250	\$383,000.00	\$471,932.68	\$209.75	23%	2.00	Hama Hama Company
106590		FINALE	Pacific	PC	9442	\$2,381,000.00	\$4,806,117.00	\$509.01	102%	4.00	Stimson Lumber Company, Inc.
106399		Q MOUNTAIN VIEW	Stevens	NE	4259	\$1,013,000.00	\$1,354,544.47	\$318.04	34%	4.00	Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
103585		EVERGREEN GOLD	Thurston	SPS	5972	\$3,100,000.00	\$3,654,406.30	\$611.92	18%	3.00	Murphy Company
106667		JUNIA	Whatcom	NW	1489	\$497,000.00	\$700,000.00	\$470.11	41%	3.00	PDJ LLC.

**SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>January 2025</b>	13	13	0	0	71,187	71,187	0	0	100%	\$19,360,280.34	\$30,485,175.50	\$428.24	57%	3.61
<b>YTD FY 2025</b>	56	55	0	1	286,702	280,913	0	5,789	98%	\$78,721,300.54	\$117,832,717.49	\$419.46	50%	2.97

**REGIONAL SALE RESULTS**

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER				
<b>YTD FY 2025</b>		8	6	0	2	6,963	6,833	0	130	98%	\$426,906.00	\$700,423.41	\$102.51	64%	1.83

**SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES**

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
<b>January 2025</b>	13	13	0	0	71,187	71,187	0	0	100%	\$19,360,280.34	\$30,485,175.50	\$428.24	57%	3.61
<b>YTD FY 2025</b>	64	61	0	3	293,665	287,746	0	5,919	98%	\$79,148,206.54	\$118,533,140.90	\$411.94	50%	2.86

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

\* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)**

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)			# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
				MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF		
107958		LAST CROCKER RESALE SORT 01 DF HQ B 12" TO 19'	649	\$725.00	\$851.00	\$297,148.75	\$378,922.75	\$583.86	5	Manke Timber Company, Inc.
107959		LAST CROCKER RESALE SORT 02 DF Sawlog 5" to 11" dib	1,268	\$550.00	\$730.00	\$383,730.18	\$611,970.18	\$482.63	3	Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.
107960		LAST CROCKER RESALE SORT 03 DF Sawlog 12" to 19" dib	2,081	\$550.00	\$795.00	\$558,907.33	\$1,068,752.33	\$513.58	6	Murphy Company
107961		LAST CROCKER RESALE SORT 04 DF Sawlog 20" +dib	289	\$500.00	\$517.94	\$35,716.45	\$40,901.11	\$141.53	4	Western Forest Products US LLC
107962		LAST CROCKER RESALE SORT 05 RC Camprun 5" + dib	139	\$1,100.00	\$1,450.00	\$115,284.70	\$163,934.70	\$1,179.39	2	Alta Forest Products, LLC
107963		LAST CROCKER RESALE SORT 06 WW SL 5" TO 11" dib	172	\$425.00	\$514.50	\$25,482.89	\$40,876.89	\$237.66	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
107964		LAST CROCKER RESALE SORT 07 WW SL 12" + dib	135	\$450.00	\$515.00	\$19,841.80	\$28,616.80	\$211.98	2	Sierra Pacific Industries
107965		LAST CROCKER RESALE SORT 08 Red Alder Sawlog 7" + dib	455	\$450.00	\$650.00	\$90,725.33	\$181,725.33	\$399.40	2	Port Angeles Hardwood
107966		LAST CROCKER RESALE SORT 09 Conifer Pulp 2" + dib	40	\$225.00	\$252.00	(\$1,824.95)	(\$744.95)	(\$18.62)	1	Evergreen Fibre
107967		LAST CROCKER RESALE SORT 10 Hardwood Pulp 2" + dib	169	\$225.00	\$265.77	(\$2,934.46)	\$3,955.67	\$23.41	4	C & C Timber, Inc.
107968		LAST CROCKER RESALE SORT 11 DF Poles 35' +	50	\$900.00	\$1,000.00	\$27,148.32	\$32,148.32	\$642.97	1	Stella-Jones Corporation