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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 

 September 2021 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 101627 QUALITY SORTS Grays Harbor PC 3987 $1,269,626.28 $1,621,631.59 $406.73 28% 3.10 See Sort Sales Results 
 87778 BLACKTIP Klickitat SE 3996 $1,252,000.00 $1,264,296.80 $316.39 1% 1.00 High Cascade, Inc. 
 101630 Q HARVARD Okanogan NE 4694 $755,000.00 NO BIDS 
 101631 Q WEST WOODY  Okanogan NE 5672 $788,000.00 $1,309,700.46 $230.91 66% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 MTN 

 101610 Q FIRECRACKER Pend Oreille NE 5985 $2,081,000.00 $2,134,684.12 $356.67 3% 1.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 101632 Q WILD WOOD Pend Oreille NE 4312 $1,310,000.00 $1,638,008.00 $379.87 25% 2.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 101695 BIG HOLLOW  Skamania PC 1874 $365,000.00 NO BIDS 
 SALVAGE 

 100467 SERENITY NOW Skamania, Clark PC 6654 $1,656,000.00 $2,187,037.94 $328.68 32% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 100354 FONTAL Snohomish NW 2651 $1,075,000.00 $1,566,375.00 $590.86 46% 4.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2021 9 7 0 2 39,825 33,257 0 6,568 84% $9,431,626.28 $11,721,733.91 $352.46 24% 2.30 
YTD FY 2022 20 17 0 3 79,158 72,898 0 6,260 93% $23,709,833.19 $30,434,065.37 $417.49 28% 2.25  

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

 September 2021 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 101695 BIG HOLLOW  Skamania PC 1874 $176,000.00 NO BIDS 
 SALVAGE 

 100487 SLAPSTICK  Snohomish, Skagit NW 656 $41,000.00 $46,070.00 $70.23 12% 2.00 Nielsen Brothers, Inc. 
 HARDWOOD 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2021 2 1 0 1 2,530 656 0 1,874 26% $41,000.00 $46,070.00 $70.23 12% 2.00 
YTD FY 2022 3 2 0 1 3,588 1,714 0 1,874 48% $147,000.00 $159,260.75 $92.92 8% 1.50 

  SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2021 11 8 0 3 42,355 33,913 0 8,442 80% $9,472,626.28 $11,767,803.91 $347.00 24% 2.26 
YTD FY 2022 23 19 0 4 82,746 74,612 0 8,134 91% $23,856,833.19 $30,593,326.12 $410.03 28% 2.17 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

 September 2021 

 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 101636 QUALITY SORT 1 1,081 $600.00 $704.00 $297,400.81 $409,824.81 $379.12 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 DF 5-11" 
 101637 QUALITY SORT 2 725 $650.00 $792.55 $197,472.88 $300,821.63 $414.93 5 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 DF 12-19" 
 101638 QUALITY SORT 3 300 $625.00 $750.00 $80,986.91 $118,486.91 $394.96 3 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc. 
 DF 20"+ 
 101639 QUALITY SORT 4 1,429 $720.00 $775.00 $604,133.16 $682,728.16 $477.77 7 Murphy Company 
 DF HQ 12"+ 
 101640 QUALITY SORT 5 41 $525.00 $525.00 $8,059.63 $8,059.63 $196.58 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 WW 5-11" 
 101641 QUALITY SORT 6 28 $550.00 $550.00 $6,724.94 $6,724.94 $240.18 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 WW 12"+ 
 101642 QUALITY SORT 7 281 $595.73 $647.86 $74,809.48 $89,459.48 $318.36 2 Cascade Hardwood, LLC 
 RA 8"+ 
 101643 QUALITY SORT 8 22 $338.00 $455.00 ($790.54) $1,783.46 $81.07 2 DaPaul Chip 
 DF Pulp 2"+ 
 101644 QUALITY SORT 9 3 $338.00 $455.00 ($107.80) $243.20 $81.07 2 DaPaul Chip 
 WW Pulp 2"+ 
 101645 QUALITY SORT 10 77 $338.00 $371.28 $936.81 $3,499.37 $45.45 3 MTS Enterprises 
 Hardwood Pulp 2"+ 
 


