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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 October 2022 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102251 ALDWELL Clallam OLY 5554 $1,701,000.00 $2,918,000.00 $525.39 72% 3.00 Bekkevar Logging and Trucking Inc.
 102260 MORSE SIEBERT  Clallam OLY 1615 $484,000.00 $621,155.93 $384.62 28% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 DIVIDE 
 103253 WALTER Cowlitz PC 4222 $1,550,000.00 $2,467,835.67 $584.52 59% 6.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 102030 T3 C-1300 Jefferson OLY 6684 $934,000.00 $2,217,858.17 $331.82 137% 2.00 Harbor Timber 
 89221 CHARLIE HORSE King SP 5492 $1,886,000.00 $3,149,477.00 $573.47 67% 5.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100455 GALAXY Klickitat SE 4497 $894,000.00 $1,864,495.84 $414.61 109% 3.00 High Cascade, Inc. 
 102827 CRAZY HAZY Lewis PC 5660 $2,055,000.00 $2,917,127.71 $515.39 42% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 102659 RALPHIE Skagit NW 2416 $889,000.00 $994,158.00 $411.49 12% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 103158 MIDGE Sorts Skagit NW 803 $387,812.10 $494,756.49 $616.14 28% 1.91 See Sort Sales Results 
 102970 SOUTHERN  Snohomish NW 2538 $369,000.00 $727,094.35 $286.48 97% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 ACCENTS 
 103128 GRAVY Snohomish NW 1111 $257,000.00 $494,916.00 $445.47 93% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

October 2022 11 11 0 0 40,592 40,579 0 13 100% $11,408,834.87 $18,866,875.16 $464.94 65% 3.26 
YTD FY 2023 32 31 0 1 134,403 129,695 0 4,708 97% $40,244,834.87 $55,130,484.82 $425.08 37% 2.71 
   
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 103632 PARADISE Clallam OLY 196 $37,000.00 NO BIDS 
 103168 Q BARBER MAN Kittitas SE 1729 $60,000.00 $60,501.00 $34.99 1% 2.00 Timbered Rangeland Management, LLC 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

October 2022 2 1 0 1 1,925 1,729 0 196 90% $60,000.00 $60,501.00 $34.99 1% 2.00 
YTD FY 2023 8 7 0 1 9,515 9,319 0 196 98% $858,876.00 $1,939,593.79 $208.13 126% 2.57 
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

October 2022 13 12 0 1 42,517 42,308 0 209 100% $11,468,834.87 $18,927,376.16 $447.37 65% 3.16 
YTD FY 2023 40 38 0 2 143,918 139,014 0 4,904 97% $41,103,710.87 $57,070,078.61 $410.53 39% 2.68 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 October 2022 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 103355 MIDGE Sort 01 124 $900.00 $960.00 $71,952.49 $79,392.49 $640.26 3 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 DF HQ 12" + SED 
 103356 MIDGE Sort 02 191 $700.00 $860.00 $76,952.38 $107,512.38 $562.89 2 Great Western Lumber Co. 
 DF Sawlog 20" + SED 
 103357 MIDGE Sort 03 227 $800.00 $900.00 $116,574.04 $139,274.04 $613.54 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 DF 12-19" SED 
 103358 MIDGE Sort 04 88 $800.00 $900.00 $43,822.42 $52,622.42 $597.98 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 DF 5-11" SED 
 103359 MIDGE Sort 05 24 $550.00 $550.00 $6,208.13 $6,208.13 $258.67 1 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 White Wood Sawlog 5"+ SED 
 103360 MIDGE Sort 06 38 $1,200.00 $1,401.99 $32,403.44 $40,079.06 $1,054.71 1 Fritch Forest Products, Inc. 
 RC Sawlog 5"+ SED 
 103361 MIDGE Sort 07 25 $1,500.00 $2,240.00 $28,953.55 $47,453.55 $1,898.14 2 Stella-Jones Corporation 
 RC Pole 35' + 
 103362 MIDGE Sort 08 25 $900.00 $1,200.00 $14,063.30 $21,563.30 $862.53 3 Stella-Jones Corporation 
 DF Pole 35'+ 
 103363 MIDGE Sort 09 26 $400.00 $400.00 $1,252.47 $1,252.47 $48.17 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 RA/BM Sawlog 8"+ SED 
 103364 MIDGE Sort 10 13 $120.00 ($2,022.77) 0 NO BIDS 
 CW Sawlog 8"+ SED 
 103365 MIDGE Sort 11 8 $225.00 $396.00 ($853.58) $514.42 $64.30 2 Willis Enterprises 
 Conifer Utility 
 103366 MIDGE Sort 12 14 $225.00 $252.00 ($1,493.77) ($1,115.77) ($79.70) 1 Willis Enterprises 
 Hardwood Utility (except cottonwood) 
 


