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* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 November 2017 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 95438 95/96 SPLIT Clallam OLY 3257 $777,000.00 $1,300,967.00 $399.44 67% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 95094 CANT DOG Cowlitz PC 4230 $1,404,000.00 $2,327,310.84 $550.19 66% 3.00 High Cascade, Inc. 
 95096 NIVLOC Cowlitz PC 7107 $2,782,000.00 NO BIDS 
 95103 WEST  Cowlitz PC 4198 $1,475,000.00 $2,556,871.49 $609.07 73% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 HERRINGTON 
 95097 BADGER Grays Harbor PC 4601 $1,698,000.00 $1,856,898.00 $403.59 9% 2.00 Western Timber, Inc. 
 95307 MAPLE SYRUP  Jefferson OLY 6660 $1,621,000.00 $2,649,522.00 $397.83 63% 2.00 Harbor Timber 
 VRH & RMZ THIN 
 94676 * LONG CUT VRH &  King SP 4835 $1,557,000.00 $2,292,504.00 $474.15 47% 4.00 Rainier Veneer, Inc. 
 RMZ 
 95616 WALK IN THE  Lewis PC 2447 $1,002,000.00 $1,117,028.00 $456.49 11% 3.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 PARK VRH RMZ 
 94076 SAW LINK Mason SP 5483 $1,815,000.00 $3,214,348.70 $586.24 77% 4.00 Murphy Company 
 94197 * HECKENPECK Pierce SP 3796 $1,452,000.00 $1,638,418.13 $431.62 13% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 95158 GREEN RIVER VRH  Snohomish NW 5048 $2,020,000.00 $2,476,906.00 $490.67 23% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 RMZ 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2017 11 10 0 1 51,662 44,555 0 7,107 86% $14,821,000.00 $21,430,774.16 $481.00 45% 2.60 
YTD FY 2018 36 35 0 1 148,273 141,166 0 7,107 95% $43,479,455.14 $63,725,149.31 $451.42 47% 2.78  
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2017 11 10 0 1 51,662 44,555 0 7,107 86% $14,821,000.00 $21,430,774.16 $481.00 45% 2.60 
YTD FY 2018 36 35 0 1 148,273 141,166 0 7,107 95% $43,479,455.14 $63,725,149.31 $451.42 47% 2.78 


