DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
TIMBER AUCTION RESULTS - JANUARY 2024

BOARD SALE RESULTS
VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION  OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
MBF BID PRICE IMBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
104811 LYRE LYRE Clallam OoLY 2167 $541,000.00 $840,000.00 $387.63 55% 3.00 Webster Logging
105887 SASSAFRAS Cowlitz PC 4898 $1,018,000.00 $1,525,339.86 $311.42 50% 5.00 Murphy Company
104741 M HORNET Lewis PC 5593 $1,851,000.00 $2,394,255.19 $428.08 29% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
104587 CROSS Pacific PC 9 ($1,400.87) ($1,400.87) ($155.65) 0% 1.00 See Sort Sales Results
POLLINATE
SORTS
105143 Q SOUTH Pend Oreille NE 3073 $977,000.00 $1,588,523.67 $516.93 63% 5.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
SACHEEN
104331 BALD BALCONY Skagit NW 3054 $619,000.00 $1,075,902.00 $352.29 74% 3.00  Sierra Pacific Industries
105934 ROCKY TOP Skamania PC 6537 $1,595,000.00 $1,936,162.41 $296.19 21% 2.00 Murphy Company
SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES
SALES SALES  SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #

OFFERED SOLD PENDING NOBID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /IMBF  OVER BIDS

January 2024 7 7 0 0 25,331 25,331 0 0 100% $6,599,599.13 $9,358,782.26 $369.46 42% 3.14
YTD FY 2024 53 53 0 0 217,119 216,690 429 100% $55,116,377.47 $80,220,484.82 $370.21 46% 3.10

o

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
104584 LOOMIS TRAIL Whatcom NW 684 $220,000.00 $319,686.00 $467.38 45% 6.00 Sierra Pacific Industries

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

SALES SALES  SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NOBID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /IMBF  OVER BIDS

January 2024 1 1 0 0 684 684 0 0 100% $220,000.00 $319,686.00 $467.38 45% 6.00
YTD FY 2024 11 9 0 2 23,268 18,260 0 5,008 78% $1,275,000.00 $2,285,754.43 $125.18 79% 2.44

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)



SALES  SALES
SOLD PENDING

January 2024 8 8 0
YTD FY 2024 64 62 0
AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE
MENT
104753 CROSS POLLINATE SORT 11

Conifer Pulp 2"+

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

SALES

SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE
NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES

0 26,015 26,015 0 0 100% $6,819,599.13 $9,678,468.26

2 240,387 234,950 0 5,437 99% $56,391,377.47 $82,506,239.25

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)
January 2024
Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)
VOLUME
OFFERED  MINIMUM BID MINIMUM TOTAL BID PRICE # OF
MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE /MBF BIDS
9 $325.00 $325.00 ($1,400.87) ($1,400.87) ($155.65) 1

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

PRICE %
IMBF  OVER

AVG #
BIDS

$372.03
$351.17

42%
46%

3.50
3.01

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.





