
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 December 2016 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 93916 LARGE FARVA Cowlitz PC 3435 $774,000.00 $1,042,079.00 $303.37 35% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 94140 LOOSE ENDS Jefferson Ol 2058 $441,000.00 $632,924.00 $307.54 44% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92988 UPPER WIKI Mason SP 2430 $567,000.00 $969,300.15 $398.89 71% 4.00 Murphy Company 
 93062 * SECOND CHANCE Mason SP 5387 $1,832,000.00 $2,962,474.42 $549.93 62% 4.00 Murphy Company 
 93900 PATHFINDER SORTS Snohomish NW 4994 $1,591,380.63 $2,096,960.63 $419.90 32% 2.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 93894 DOUGLAS FLATS Stevens NE 2536 $529,000.00 $825,690.03 $325.59 56% 1.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 93947 ALICE MAE Stevens NE 4119 $757,000.00 $1,013,284.61 $246.00 34% 1.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 93508 CRAWFORD 17 Thurston SP 2948 $788,000.00 $1,333,273.77 $452.26 69% 5.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93966 INNER LIMITS Wahkiakum PC 5906 $1,555,000.00 $2,070,430.00 $350.56 33% 4.00 Columbia Vista Corporation 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2016 9 9 0 0 33,813 33,813 0 0 100% $8,834,380.63 $12,946,416.61 $382.88 47% 3.00 
YTD FY 2017 49 49 0 0 182,628 182,628 0 0 100% $44,364,516.17 $60,942,065.59 $333.70 37% 2.78   

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2016 9 9 0 0 33,813 33,813 0 0 100% $8,834,380.63 $12,946,416.61 $382.88 47% 3.00 
YTD FY 2017 49 49 0 0 182,628 182,628 0 0 100% $44,364,516.17 $60,942,065.59 $333.70 37% 2.78 

 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 94349 PATHFINDER Sort 01 1,280 $570.00 $650.00 $519,454.30 $621,854.30 $485.82 4 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 94350 PATHFINDER Sort 02 951 $570.00 $616.00 $334,869.61 $378,615.61 $398.12 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 94351 PATHFINDER Sort 03 1,612 $450.00 $534.00 $361,883.80 $497,291.80 $308.49 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 94352 PATHFINDER Sort 04 820 $450.00 $534.00 $199,107.21 $267,987.21 $326.81 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 94353 PATHFINDER Sort 05 236 $1,100.00 $1,750.00 $167,907.79 $321,307.79 $1,361.47 3 Columbia Cedar, Inc. 
 94354 PATHFINDER Sort 06 18 $550.00 $640.00 $6,096.13 $7,716.13 $428.67 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 94355 PATHFINDER Sort 07 70 $225.00 $225.00 $2,325.66 $2,325.66 $33.22 1 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 94356 PATHFINDER Sort 08 7 $207.00 $225.00 ($263.87) ($137.87) ($19.70) 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 


