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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 

 September 2020 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100261 CUSTOM  Clark PC 3657 $1,321,273.81 $2,732,907.21 $747.31 107% 4.11 See Sort Sales Results 
 TAILORED SORTS 

 98540 * SOUTH GRASS King SP 8338 $1,086,000.00 $2,315,555.00 $277.71 113% 3.00 Rainier Veneer, Inc. 
 99065 * SUNNY SIDE Lewis SP 3555 $556,000.00 $1,212,460.00 $341.06 118% 4.00 Rainier Veneer, Inc. 
 99593 COOPER Lewis PC 3652 $898,000.00 $1,636,749.00 $448.18 82% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100127 RICKY BOBBY  Lewis PC 5193 $1,310,371.65 $3,084,309.65 $593.94 135% 4.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 

 98547 PONY UP SORTS Skagit NW 6366 $2,504,643.32 $3,724,563.17 $585.07 49% 2.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 100580 Q HUNGRY ELK Spokane NE 6140 $972,000.00 $1,740,650.00 $283.49 79% 4.00 PotlatchDeltic Land & Lumber, LLC 

 99049 JANEWAY VRH &  Thurston SP 5505 $1,556,000.00 $2,607,278.00 $473.62 68% 3.00 Western Timber, Inc. 
 VDT 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2020 8 8 0 0 42,406 42,355 0 51 100% $10,215,637.63 $19,054,472.03 $449.88 87% 3.26 
YTD FY 2021 22 22 0 0 106,750 106,616 0 134 100% $23,356,360.22 $42,642,541.39 $399.96 83% 2.79   

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

YTD FY 2021 3 2 0 1 4,078 3,832 0 246 94% $225,000.00 $611,588.00 $159.60 172% 3.00   

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2020 8 8 0 0 42,406 42,355 0 51 100% $10,215,637.63 $19,054,472.03 $449.88 87% 3.26 
YTD FY 2021 25 24 0 1 110,828 110,448 0 380 100% $23,581,360.22 $43,254,129.39 $391.62 83% 2.81 



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

 September 2020 

 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100128 RICKY BOBBY SORT 1 374 $550.00 $820.00 $123,127.65 $224,107.65 $599.22 5 Murphy Company 
 100129 RICKY BOBBY SORT 2 763 $560.00 $1,100.00 $206,542.82 $618,562.82 $810.70 7 Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC 
 100130 RICKY BOBBY SORT 3 358 $550.00 $785.00 $132,269.66 $216,399.66 $604.47 5 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 100131 RICKY BOBBY SORT 4 932 $650.00 $1,100.00 $347,643.76 $767,043.76 $823.01 7 Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC 
 100132 RICKY BOBBY SORT 5 679 $450.00 $654.00 $176,559.23 $315,075.23 $464.03 4 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100133 RICKY BOBBY SORT 6 78 $950.00 $1,665.00 $59,103.59 $114,873.59 $1,472.74 2 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 100134 RICKY BOBBY SORT 7 74 $425.00 $600.00 $18,638.26 $31,588.26 $426.87 2 Cascade Hardwood, LLC 
 100135 RICKY BOBBY SORT 8 124 $286.53 $390.00 ($3,535.17) $9,294.83 $74.96 4 Cascade Hardwood, LLC 
 100136 RICKY BOBBY SORT 9 53 $387.17 $390.00 $2,816.85 $2,966.85 $55.98 3 DaPaul Chip 
 100137 RICKY BOBBY SORT 10 157 $125.27 $125.41 ($1,977.88) ($1,955.88) ($12.46) 2 Cascade Hardwood, LLC 
 100138 RICKY BOBBY SORT 11 1,357 $450.00 $800.00 $209,640.65 $684,590.65 $504.49 3 Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC 
 100262 CUSTOM TAILORED SORT 1 666 $550.00 $822.12 $230,322.07 $411,553.99 $617.95 6 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 100263 CUSTOM TAILORED SORT 2 1,413 $560.00 $1,100.00 $458,573.51 $1,221,593.51 $864.54 6 Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC 
 100264 CUSTOM TAILORED SORT 3 938 $525.00 $750.00 $350,904.80 $561,954.80 $599.10 6 Western Forest Products 
 100265 CUSTOM TAILORED SORT 4 448 $650.00 $1,100.00 $199,269.92 $400,869.92 $894.80 8 Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC 
 100266 CUSTOM TAILORED SORT 5 139 $750.00 $1,075.00 $75,868.83 $121,043.83 $870.82 2 Bell Timber, Inc. 
 100267 CUSTOM TAILORED SORT 6 32 $400.00 $630.00 $5,410.21 $12,770.21 $399.07 2 Cascade Hardwood, LLC 
 100268 CUSTOM TAILORED SORT 7 5 $450.00 $580.00 $1,329.29 $1,979.29 $395.86 1 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 100269 CUSTOM TAILORED SORT 8 8 $286.00 $479.31 ($813.93) $732.55 $91.57 3 Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC 
 100270 CUSTOM TAILORED SORT 9 8 $390.00 $390.00 $409.11 $409.11 $51.14 3 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 100706 PONY UP Sort 01 937 $690.00 $895.00 $408,691.35 $600,776.35 $641.17 1 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 100707 PONY UP Sort 02 1,143 $690.00 $832.00 $529,494.82 $691,800.82 $605.25 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100708 PONY UP Sort 03 857 $600.00 $775.00 $307,723.04 $457,698.04 $534.07 2 Great Western Lumber Co. 
 100709 PONY UP Sort 04 1,828 $650.00 $832.00 $766,900.95 $1,099,596.95 $601.53 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100710 PONY UP Sort 05 871 $600.00 $833.00 $308,874.07 $511,817.07 $587.62 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100711 PONY UP Sort 06 389 $480.00 $675.00 $95,254.45 $171,109.45 $439.87 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100712 PONY UP Sort 07 111 $1,050.00 $1,681.00 $70,651.51 $140,692.51 $1,267.50 4 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 100713 PONY UP Sort 08 100 $850.00 $1,051.50 $45,108.01 $65,258.01 $652.58 2 Stella-Jones Corporation 
 100714 PONY UP Sort 09 42 $490.00 $550.00 $8,896.86 $11,416.86 $271.83 2 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 100715 PONY UP Sort 10 14 $200.00 $200.00 ($761.74) ($761.74) ($54.41) 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 100716 PONY UP Sort 11 12 $190.00 ($248.28) 0 NO BIDS 

 100717 PONY UP Sort 12 39 $225.00 ($11,100.57) 0 NO BIDS 
 100718 PONY UP Sort 13 23 $198.00 $198.00 ($24,841.15) ($24,841.15) ($1,080.05) 1 MTS Enterprises 
 100984 RICKY BOBBY SORT 12 244 $400.00 $655.00 $39,542.23 $101,762.23 $417.06 4 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 


