
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 

 September 2017 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 95108 SHORT STACK Jefferson OLY 3731 $665,000.00 $1,211,548.00 $324.72 82% 3.00 Harbor Timber 
 94072 * GRINDER Lewis SP 3905 $999,000.00 $1,783,186.00 $456.64 78% 3.00 A & W Timber Brokers, Inc. 
 95113 UPPER ECHELON Lewis PC 5001 $1,581,000.00 $2,519,357.00 $503.77 59% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2017 3 3 0 0 12,637 12,637 0 0 100% $3,245,000.00 $5,514,091.00 $436.34 70% 3.00 
YTD FY 2018 12 12 0 0 35,525 35,525 0 0 100% $7,984,562.04 $12,580,974.34 $354.14 58% 2.53  

  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2017 3 3 0 0 12,637 12,637 0 0 100% $3,245,000.00 $5,514,091.00 $436.34 70% 3.00 
YTD FY 2018 12 12 0 0 35,525 35,525 0 0 100% $7,984,562.04 $12,580,974.34 $354.14 58% 2.53 


