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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 October 2020 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 99655 FLUTTERBY Clallam OLY 3282 $1,002,000.00 $1,005,001.00 $306.22 0% 2.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. 
 100646 KINGS SILVER Clallam OLY 3094 $734,000.00 $1,133,281.00 $366.28 54% 3.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 100110 BROOM CLOSET Cowlitz PC 4226 $1,449,000.00 $1,735,419.00 $410.65 20% 2.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 99242 SOLLEKS BOTTOM Jefferson OLY 8767 $1,399,000.00 NO BIDS 
 100645 BULL MILL Jefferson OLY 4044      $969,000.00    $1,151,471.00     $284.74     19%     1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 99045 PERTNEAR King SP 3363 $1,163,000.00 $1,611,055.00 $479.05 39% 6.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 99070 LOST VRH & WMZ Mason SP 3083 $1,068,000.00 $1,506,763.00 $488.73 41% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100214 BRISKAET Pacific PC 6211 $2,447,000.00 $2,690,562.75 $433.19 10% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 96781 HOOTENANNY Skagit NW 1423 $608,000.00 $881,600.00 $619.54 45% 4.00 Nielsen Brothers, Inc. 
 98547 PONY UP SORTS Skagit NW 51 ($13,901.78) ($1,748.21) ($34.28) 0% 2.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 100426 NINE POUND  Skagit NW 2546 $1,028,000.00 $1,483,555.33 $582.70 44% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 HAMMER 
 100322 LONE RIDER Snohomish NW 2272 $786,000.00 $1,040,056.00 $457.77 32% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 97288 ONION Thurston SP 7030 $2,751,000.00 $4,516,225.68 $642.42 64% 4.00 Stella-Jones Corporation 
 98887 JACK A ROE Whatcom NW 4255 $1,311,000.00 $1,469,276.31 $345.31 12% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

October 2020 14 13 0 1 53,647 44,841 0 8,806 84% $15,314,251.79 $20,222,517.86 $450.98 32% 2.62 
YTD FY 2021 35 34 0 1 160,346 151,457 0 8,889 95% $38,670,612.01 $62,771,859.25 $414.45 62% 2.73  

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100611 Q KNIGHTS Spokane NE 1898 $110,000.00 $205,085.55 $108.05 86% 2.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

October 2020 1 1 0 0 1,898 1,898 0 0 100% $110,000.00 $205,085.55 $108.05 86% 2.00 
YTD FY 2021 4 3 0 1 5,976 5,730 0 246 96% $335,000.00 $816,673.55 $142.53 144% 2.67 

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

October 2020 15 14 0 1 55,545 46,739 0 8,806 84% $15,424,251.79 $20,427,603.41 $437.06 32% 2.57 
YTD FY 2021 39 37 0 2 166,322 157,187 0 9,135 95% $39,005,612.01 $63,588,532.80 $404.54 63% 2.72 



 Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 October 2020 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100716 PONY UP Sort 11 12 $150.00 $150.00 ($1,748.21) ($1,748.21) ($145.68) 2 Fritch Forest Products, Inc. 
 100717 PONY UP Sort 12 39 $198.00 ($12,153.57) 0 NO BIDS 


