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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 November 2021 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102024 BLACK DIAMOND Clallam OLY 5469 $1,931,000.00 $2,449,393.48 $447.87 27% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 101634 MICHIGAN TROTTER Clark PC 2659 $901,000.00 $1,136,225.00 $427.31 26% 2.00 NW Timber LLC 
 101895 PARCHED LARCH Clark PC 3117 $1,042,000.00 $1,302,096.55 $417.74 25% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 101120 CAT GAME Cowlitz PC 5930 $2,721,000.00 $3,591,450.85 $605.64 32% 6.00 Western Forest Products US LLC 
 101625 SPITTOON SORTS Grays Harbor PC 5406 $1,793,191.80 $2,419,989.40 $447.65 35% 2.45 See Sort Sales Results 
 101979 Q RABBIT RIDGE Okanogan NE 3832 $601,000.00 $649,707.05 $169.55 8% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 100671 * FLAT TOP Pierce SP 4950 $2,100,000.00 $2,689,993.71 $543.43 28% 4.00 Murphy Company 
 101416 BACK N FORTH Skagit NW 2409 $1,109,000.00 $1,701,649.00 $706.37 53% 4.00 Nielsen Brothers, Inc. 
 100997 * COPPER RIDGE  Thurston SP 1387 $615,000.00 $766,904.60 $552.92 25% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 2022 VDT & VRH 
 100998 * CRUSH Thurston SP 6150 $2,567,000.00 $2,658,505.00 $432.28 4% 2.00 Cascade Hardwood, LLC 
 86037 GREEN THOMAS Wahkiakum PC 7267 $2,288,000.00 $2,653,147.51 $365.10 16% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 99427 FLYWHEEL Whatcom NW 3004 $764,000.00 $804,651.64 $267.86 5% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 101867 TILLER HARDWOOD Whatcom NW 2429 $525,000.00 $675,025.00 $277.90 29% 5.00 Frank Harkness Trucking and Logging 
 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2021 13 13 0 0 54,009 54,009 0 0 100% $18,957,191.80 $23,498,738.79 $435.09 24% 3.03 
YTD FY 2022 41 36 0 5 171,302 151,693 0 19,609 89% $50,666,024.99 $63,954,073.65 $421.60 26% 2.70    
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102788 Q BIG BOX  Okanogan NE 200 $34,920.00 $36,666.00 $183.33 5% 1.00 Methow Valley Home & Garden 
 SALVAGE 
 102804 Q HAPPY  Stevens NE 2030 $127,790.00 $154,370.32 $76.04 21% 2.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 SALVAGE 
 101463 Q COYOTE BAR Yakima SE 1380 $96,000.00 $282,763.00 $204.90 195% 3.00 Woodgrain Lumber 
 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2021 3 3 0 0 3,610 3,610 0 0 100% $258,710.00 $473,799.32 $131.25 83% 2.00 
YTD FY 2022 7 6 0 1 7,214 5,340 0 1,874 93% $507,210.00 $867,014.37 $129.02 71% 2.29 
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2021 16 16 0 0 57,619 57,619 0 0 100% $19,215,901.80 $23,972,538.11 $416.05 25% 2.84 
YTD FY 2022 48 42 0 6 178,516 157,033 0 21,483 89% $51,173,234.99 $64,821,088.02 $412.79 27% 2.63 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

November 2021 

 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 101751 SPITTOON SORT 1 572 $700.00 $780.00 $228,755.24 $274,515.24 $479.92 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 DF 5"-11" 
 101752 SPITTOON SORT 2 1,124 $725.00 $780.00 $464,303.88 $526,123.88 $468.08 4 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 DF 12" - 19" 
 101753 SPITTOON SORT 3 1,113 $700.00 $870.00 $300,690.03 $489,900.03 $440.16 3 Great Western Lumber Co. 
 DF 20"+ 
 101754 SPITTOON SORT 4 765 $750.00 $917.17 $292,024.79 $419,909.84 $548.90 5 Western Forest Products US LLC 
 DF HQ 12"-19" 
 101755 SPITTOON SORT 5 660 $750.00 $875.00 $254,213.35 $336,713.35 $510.17 3 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 DF HQ 20"+ 
 101756 SPITTOON SORT 6 334 $350.00 $465.00 $15,992.50 $54,402.50 $162.88 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 MA 8"+ 
 101757 SPITTOON SORT 7 410 $625.00 $774.00 $131,836.22 $192,926.22 $470.55 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 RA 5"+ 
 101758 SPITTOON SORT 8 66 $1,400.00 $1,404.00 $68,853.30 $69,117.30 $1,047.23 2 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 RC 5"+ 
 101759 SPITTOON SORT 9 35 $525.00 $526.33 $5,859.06 $5,905.61 $168.73 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 WW 5"+ 
 101760 SPITTOON SORT 10 35 $364.00 $442.00 $3,936.16 $6,666.16 $190.46 1 Willis Enterprises 
 Conifer Pulp 2"+ 
 101761 SPITTOON SORT 11 292 $390.00 $448.50 $26,727.27 $43,809.27 $150.03 1 Cascade Hardwood, LLC 
 Hardwood Pulp 2"+ 
  


