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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 May 2021 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100648 GOLLY G Clallam OLY 2862 $678,000.00 $909,328.00 $317.72 34% 3.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 100651 CLARK FLATS VRH  Clallam OLY 5645 $1,409,000.00 $1,718,846.00 $304.49 22% 3.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 VDT 
 101119 DOUBLE HAUL Cowlitz PC 5831 $1,197,000.00 $2,321,266.05 $398.09 94% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 100657 MACKEREL Jefferson OLY 6274 $1,479,000.00 $2,950,158.00 $470.22 99% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100658 MT JUPITER ACCESS Jefferson OLY 5697 $1,766,000.00 $1,766,222.00 $310.03 0% 1.00 Manke Timber Company, Inc. 

 100665 SOUTH FORK HOH Jefferson OLY 6863 $984,000.00 $1,426,857.00 $207.91 45% 2.00 Harbor Timber 
 100003 CASKEY EAST Skagit NW 2881 $1,304,000.00 $1,914,702.68 $664.60 47% 4.00 Stella-Jones Corporation 
 101432 FARFEGDOUGAN Skamania PC 9004 $2,423,000.00 $3,085,974.00 $342.73 27% 1.00 High Cascade, Inc. 
 101133 SKID PLATE Snohomish NW 7836 $3,074,000.00 $4,643,957.00 $592.64 51% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100457 BELL BOY Sorts Whatcom NW 289 ($39,568.80) ($39,568.80) ($136.92) 0% 1.50 See Sort Sales Results 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2021 10 10 0 0 53,182 53,182 0 0 100% $14,274,431.20 $20,697,741.93 $389.19 45% 2.55 
YTD FY 2021 101 100 0 1 510,803 506,196 0 4,607 99% $147,438,721.06 $204,692,137.36 $404.37 39% 2.47   

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 101512 Q TAN MAN Kittitas SE 1455 $136,000.00 $198,088.10 $136.14 46% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 101946 Q NOT MY FIRST  Klickitat SE 109 $7,000.00 $10,750.00 $98.62 54% 2.00 Eddie Murray Enterprises, Inc. 
 RODEO THIN 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2021 2 2 0 0 1,564 1,564 0 0 100% $143,000.00 $208,838.10 $133.53 46% 2.50 
YTD FY 2021 7 6 0 1 10,817 10,571 0 246 98% $709,000.00 $1,754,468.40 $165.97 147% 2.50  

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2021 12 12 0 0 54,746 54,746 0 0 100% $14,417,431.20 $20,906,580.03 $381.88 45% 2.54 
YTD FY 2021 108 106 0 2 521,620 516,767 0 4,853 99% $148,147,721.06 $206,446,605.76 $399.50 39% 2.47 



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 May 2021 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 
 101163 BELL BOY Sort 12 196 $150.00 $150.00 ($35,542.77) ($35,542.77) ($181.34) 1 Fritch Forest Products, Inc. 
  CW Sawlog  8"+ 
 101165 BELL BOY Sort 14 93 $180.00 $180.00 ($4,026.03) ($4,026.03) ($43.29) 2 Synergy Excavation 
  Hardwood Utility 


