DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
TIMBER AUCTION RESULTS - DECEMBER 2023

BOARD SALE RESULTS
VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION  OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
MBF BID PRICE IMBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER

103506 PHIR SORTS Cowlitz PC 1250 $229,283.12 $534,545.62 $427.64 133% 4.00 See Sort Sales Results
104153 MM MM GOOD Grays Harbor PC 4862 $1,036,000.00 $1,571,657.58 $323.25 52% 4.00 Harbor Timber
104812 LAST CROCKER Jefferson OoLY 5447 $1,609,963.09 $2,318,887.09 $425.72 44% 2.73 See Sort Sales Results

SORTS
104375 HUMDINGER Lewis PC 5539 $1,642,000.00 $2,805,352.00 $506.47 71% 4.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products,

L.P.

103627 *  TRAIL MIX Mason SP 7204 $3,212,000.00 $4,520,103.75 $627.44 41% 4.00 Murphy Company
104295 BANDICOOT Skagit NW 987 $365,000.00 $745,893.00 $755.72 104% 5.00  Sierra Pacific Industries
104661 PLEIADES Skagit NW 2475 $1,066,000.00 $1,492,731.00 $603.12 40% 5.00  Sierra Pacific Industries
104159 UPPER LEFT Skamania PC 30 ($5,825.79) ($5,825.79) ($194.19) 0% 1.00  See Sort Sales Results

SORTS

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES
SALES  SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #

OFFERED SOLD PENDING NOBID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /IMBF  OVER BIDS

December 2023 8 8 0 0 27,794 27,794 0 0 100% $9,154,420.42 $13,983,344.25 $503.11 53% 3.72
YTD FY 2024 47 47 0 0 191,797 191,359 0 438  101% $48,516,778.34 $70,861,702.56 $370.31 46% 3.07
REGION SALE RESUTLTS
VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION  OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
MBF BID PRICE IMBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
103773 LIZARD BREATH Clallam OLY 4822 $90,000.00 $91,280.00 $18.93 1% 1.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

SALES SALES  SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NOBID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /IMBF  OVER BIDS

December 2023 1 1 0 0 4,822 4,822 0 0 100% $90,000.00 $91,280.00 $18.93 1% 1.00
YTD FY 2024 10 8 0 2 22,584 17,576 0 5,008 78% $1,055,000.00 $1,966,068.43 $111.86 86% 2.00

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)



December 2023 9 9 0
YTD FY 2024 57 55 0
AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE

MENT

105163 UPPER LEFT SORT 4
WW 5"+

105165 UPPER LEFT SORT 6
Pulp 2"+

105966 LAST CROCKER SORT 01
DF HQ B 12" to 19" dib

105967 LAST CROCKER SORT 02
DF SL 5" to 11"dib

105968 LAST CROCKER SORT 03
DF SL 12" to 19" dib

105969 LAST CROCKER SORT 04
DF SL 20" + dib

105970 LAST CROCKER SORT 05
RC Camprun 5" + dib

105971 LAST CROCKER SORT 06
WW SL 5" to 11" dib

105972 LAST CROCKER SORT 07
WW SL 12"+ dib

105973 LAST CROCKER SORT 08
Red Alder Sawlog 7" + dib

105974 LAST CROCKER SORT 09
Conifer Pulp 2" + dib

105975 LAST CROCKER SORT 10
Hardwood Pulp 2" + dib

105976 LAST CROCKER SORT 11
DF Poles 35'+

106172 PHIR SORT 8
DF 5"+

SALES  SALES

SALES
OFFERED SOLD PENDING

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE
NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES
0 32,616 32,616 0 0 100% $9,244,420.42 $14,074,624.25
2 214,381 208,935 0 5,446 99% $49,571,778.34 $72,827,770.99
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)
Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)
VOLUME TOTAL

OFFERED  MINIMUM BID MINIMUM TOTAL BID PRICE # OF
MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE /MBF BIDS

9 $450.00 $450.00 $1,486.40 $1,486.40 $165.16 1

21 $325.00 $325.00 ($7,312.19) ($7,312.19) ($348.20) 1

649 $780.86 $800.00 $329,868.19 $342,293.19 $527.42 3

1,268 $550.00 $716.00 $383,730.18 $594,218.18 $468.63 4

2,081 $550.00 $700.00 $558,907.33 $871,057.33 $418.58 6

289 $500.00 $675.00 $72,433.90 $123,008.90 $425.64 3

139 $1,100.00 $1,450.00 $104,161.92 $152,811.92 $1,099.37 2

172 $425.00 $438.00 $29,789.77 $32,025.77 $186.20 3

135 $450.00 $485.00 $22,733.50 $27,458.50 $203.40 4

455 $450.00 $585.00 $90,725.33 $152,150.33 $334.40 2

40 $225.00 $225.00 ($1,824.95) ($1,824.95) ($45.62) 1

169 $225.00 $225.00 ($7,710.40) ($7,710.40) ($45.62) 1

50 $900.00 $51,250.00 $27,148.32 $33,398.32 $667.97 1

1,250 $525.00 $769.21 $229,283.12 $534,545.62 $427.64 4

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

PRICE %
/IMBF  OVER

AVG #
BIDS

$431.53 52% 341
$3348.57 47% 2.92

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

RSG Forest Products, Inc.

Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.

Murphy Company

Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.

Murphy Company

Buse Timber & Sales, Inc.

Alta Forest Products, LLC

Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.

Rainier Veneer, Inc.

Port Angeles Hardwood

Evergreen Fibre

Evergreen Fibre

Stella-Jones Corporation

Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.





