
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

BOARD SALE RESULTS 

September 2022

VOLUME

AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
 MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

102759 TRAP 15 Pacific PC 6774 $1,767,000.00 $3,000,493.03 $442.94 70% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.

102790 BEDFORD Pacific PC 3568 $1,330,000.00 $1,403,815.77 $393.45 6% 1.00 Murphy Company

101956 UNIBROW Wahkiakum PC 1103 $424,000.00 $496,191.12 $449.86 17% 5.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.

102825 PINNACOAL Whatcom NW 3435 $942,000.00 $1,669,232.00 $485.95 77% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #

OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2022 4 4 0 0 14,880 14,880 0 0 100% $4,463,000.00 $6,569,731.92 $441.51 47% 3.00

YTD FY 2023 21 20 0 1 93,811 89,116 0 4,695 95% $28,836,000.00 $36,263,609.66 $406.93 26% 2.40

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

VOLUME

AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
 MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

103791 DRY FIRE Jefferson, Clallam OLY 754 $94,000.00 $190,936.00 $253.23 103% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries

103037 Q COOK Okanogan NE 2252 $189,000.00 $283,367.83 $125.83 50% 2.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #

OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2022 2 2 0 0 3,006 3,006 0 0 100% $283,000.00 $474,303.83 $157.79 68% 2.50

YTD FY 2023 6 6 0 0 7,590 7,590 0 0 100% $798,876.00 $1,879,092.79 $247.57 135% 2.67

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #

OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2022 6 6 0 0 17,886 17,886 0 0 100% $4,746,000.00 $7,044,035.75 $393.83 48% 2.83
YTD FY 2023 27 26 0 1 101,401 96,706 0 4,695 95% $29,634,876.00 $38,142,702.45 $394.42 29% 2.46




