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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 September 2014 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 90552 * PUMPKIN VDT &  King SP 3440 $570,000.00 $659,826.72 $191.81 16% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 VRH 
 90782 GLASSER HILL Stevens NE 4179 $658,000.00 $710,846.51 $170.10 8% 1.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products,  
 90906 HUCKLEBERRY  Stevens NE 6548 $1,163,000.00 $1,555,808.00 $237.60 34% 1.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 RIDGE 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2014 3 3 0 0 14,167 14,167 0 0 100% $2,391,000.00 $2,926,481.23 $206.57 22% 1.33 
YTD FY 2015 13 13 0 0 40,818 40,818 0 0 100% $8,742,375.00 $11,816,404.82 $289.49 35% 2.10 
   
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 91637 NORTH FORK  Clallam Ol 618 $131,000.00 $188,353.00 $304.78 44% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 SEKIU 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2014 1 1 0 0 618 618 0 0 100% $131,000.00 $188,353.00 $304.78 44% 2.00 
YTD FY 2015 4 3 0 1 4,724 1,303 0 3,421 28% $258,000.00 $318,903.00 $244.75 24% 1.67  
  

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2014 4 4 0 0 14,785 14,785 0 0 100% $2,522,000.00 $3,114,834.23 $210.68 24% 1.50 
YTD FY 2015 17 16 0 1 45,542 42,121 0 3,421 92% $9,000,375.00 $12,135,307.82 $288.11 35% 2.02 


