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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 

 November 2019 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 97595 BUTTER VRH RMZ Cowlitz PC 5162 $890,000.00 $1,403,046.76 $271.80 58% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 98222 DADDY  Grays Harbor PC 7438 $2,067,000.00 $2,075,000.00 $278.97 0% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 LONGLEGS 
 94682 MATCHSTICK VRH  King SP 1880 $257,000.00 $570,917.24 $303.68 122% 4.00 Rainier Veneer, Inc. 
 & RMZ THIN 
 98559 Q AIRPORT Klickitat, Yakima SE 3722 $379,000.00 $817,162.00 $219.55 116% 3.00 Woodgrain Lumber 
 97372 * KENO VRH & RMZ  Lewis SP 4228 $610,000.00 $952,693.00 $225.33 56% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 THIN 
 98228 HARMONIOUS VRH Lewis PC 4646 $997,000.00 $1,859,325.96 $400.20 86% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
  RMZ 
 98286 HOLY COW VRH  Lewis PC 6449 $2,006,000.00 $2,459,451.43 $381.37 23% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 RMZ 
 98546 MILLHOUSE Skagit NW 1743 $386,000.00 $534,421.01 $306.61 38% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 98217 Q SHERRY RIDGE Stevens, Pend  NE 5544 $737,000.00 NO BIDS 
 Oreille 
 97285 COHO Thurston SP 6367 $1,701,000.00 $2,489,640.84 $391.02 46% 2.00 Murphy Company 
 99005 POWDER HOUSE  Wahkiakum PC 4696 $1,351,756.05 $1,738,882.80 $370.29 29% 3.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 VRH RMZ SORTS 
 98526 LAAU VRH RMZ Whatcom NW 2271 $581,000.00 $811,103.00 $357.16 40% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2019 12 11 0 1 54,146 48,602 0 5,544 90% $11,225,756.05 $15,711,644.04 $323.27 40% 2.64 
YTD FY 2020 48 40 0 8 199,073 164,036 0 35,037 83% $33,377,162.56 $44,052,287.38 $268.55 32% 2.41   

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2019 12 11 0 1 54,146 48,602 0 5,544 90% $11,225,756.05 $15,711,644.04 $323.27 40% 2.64 
YTD FY 2020 50 42 0 8 201,182 166,145 0 35,037 83% $33,730,162.56 $44,566,354.76 $268.24 32% 2.37 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

 November 2019 

 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 99006 POWDER HOUSE VRH RMZ SORT 1 1,515 $550.00 $643.39 $541,579.01 $683,064.86 $450.87 4 Interfor U.S., Inc. 

 99007 POWDER HOUSE VRH RMZ SORT 2 495 $600.00 $631.25 $203,389.51 $218,858.26 $442.14 3 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 

 99008 POWDER HOUSE VRH RMZ SORT 3 511 $650.00 $678.75 $237,302.21 $251,993.46 $493.14 2 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 

 99009 POWDER HOUSE VRH RMZ SORT 4 750 $450.00 $558.67 $129,065.92 $210,568.42 $280.76 3 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 

 99010 POWDER HOUSE VRH RMZ SORT 5 1,160 $475.00 $566.74 $216,697.16 $323,115.56 $278.55 3 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 

 99011 POWDER HOUSE VRH RMZ SORT 6 176 $390.00 $494.00 $15,755.15 $34,059.15 $193.52 3 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 

 99012 POWDER HOUSE VRH RMZ SORT 7 89 $390.00 $494.00 $7,967.09 $17,223.09 $193.52 3 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 


