
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 November 2015 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92718 PREACHERS POINT Clallam Ol 1527 $101,000.00 $101,795.00 $66.66 1% 1.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
  VDT 
 92312 RIDGE WALKER  Cowlitz PC 5338 $1,207,671.91 $1,293,847.76 $242.38 7% 1.85 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 92629 DOOGIE  Grays Harbor,  PC 2562 $228,000.00 $560,848.40 $218.91 146% 5.00 B&L Bulldozing, LLC 
 THINNING Lewis 
 92036 * GREEN SIMON Kitsap SP 3388 $898,000.00 $1,087,958.22 $321.12 21% 2.00 Murphy Company 
 91842 SOUTH PARK Klickitat SE 908 $87,000.00 $135,316.31 $149.03 56% 4.00 WyEast Timber Services, LLC. 
 92576 TOUPEE  Lewis PC 1086 $119,000.00 $249,083.70 $229.36 109% 5.00 B&L Bulldozing, LLC 
 THINNING 
 92774 SHOWJUMPER  Lewis PC 5380 $1,669,114.49 $2,069,704.30 $384.70 24% 2.25 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 92235 DOUGLAS  Okanogan NE 1208 $123,000.00 $352,205.20 $291.56 186% 2.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 MOUNTAIN 
 92186 VON TRAP Pacific PC 6603 $1,115,000.00 $1,141,067.59 $172.81 2% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92688 JADE Pacific PC 4052 $1,033,000.00 $1,417,096.00 $349.73 37% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92689 HALFMOON  Pacific PC 1846 $348,000.00 $426,183.00 $230.87 22% 2.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. 
 HARDWOOD 
 92229 NEWMAN VRH &  Skagit NW 4897 $1,055,000.00 NO BIDS 
 VDT 
 91933 ALPINE RIDGE Thurston SP 3325 $1,028,000.00 $1,380,768.00 $415.27 34% 4.00 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2015 13 12 0 1 42,120 37,117 0 5,003 88% $7,924,986.40 $10,215,873.48 $275.23 29% 2.84 
YTD FY 2016 42 38 0 4 146,940 132,646 0 14,294 90% $29,827,031.77 $40,611,098.89 $306.16 36% 2.60  
  

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 
None offered 
YTD FY 2016 5 5 0 0 6,546 6,546 0 0 100% $540,000.00 $986,060.99 $150.64 83% 2.00   
  

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2015 13 12 0 1 42,120 37,117 0 5,003 88% $7,924,986.40 $10,215,873.48 $275.23 29% 2.84 
YTD FY 2016 47 43 0 4 153,486 139,192 0 14,294 91% $30,367,031.77 $41,597,159.88 $298.85 37% 2.53 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 November 2015 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92136 GOLDEN HALO FH FIT SORT #06 1,257 $360.00 $420.00 ($16,328.90) $59,091.10 $47.01 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 92137 GOLDEN HALO FH FIT SORT #07 1,115 $324.00 $440.10 ($117,381.16) $12,070.34 $10.83 3 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 92138 GOLDEN HALO FH FIT SORT #08 429 $268.84 $268.84 ($83,203.34) ($83,203.34) ($193.95) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 92139 GOLDEN HALO FH FIT SORT #09 55 $261.00 $261.00 ($9,181.47) ($9,181.47) ($166.94) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 92140 GOLDEN HALO FH FIT SORT #10 138 $198.00 $225.00 ($25,049.38) ($21,323.38) ($154.52) 4 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 92313 RIDGE WALKER SORT 1 152 $440.00 $465.84 $34,602.80 $38,530.48 $253.49 2 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92314 RIDGE WALKER SORT 2 738 $510.00 $560.16 $223,370.46 $260,388.54 $352.83 4 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92315 RIDGE WALKER SORT 3 273 $525.00 $624.11 $66,652.95 $93,709.98 $343.26 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92316 RIDGE WALKER SORT 4 534 $575.00 $628.62 $180,710.94 $209,344.02 $392.03 3 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 92317 RIDGE WALKER SORT 5 341 $600.00 $628.62 $126,821.31 $136,580.73 $400.53 2 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 92318 RIDGE WALKER SORT 6 291 $382.58 $388.78 $29,325.75 $31,131.77 $106.98 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92319 RIDGE WALKER SORT 7 1,050 $425.00 $427.30 $172,725.00 $175,140.00 $166.80 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92320 RIDGE WALKER SORT 8 415 $425.00 $426.85 $76,484.50 $77,252.25 $186.15 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92321 RIDGE WALKER SORT 9 601 $425.00 $425.01 $108,119.90 $108,125.91 $179.91 2 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 92322 RIDGE WALKER SORT 10 778 $425.00 $425.01 $151,873.38 $151,881.16 $195.22 2 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 92323 RIDGE WALKER SORT 11 106 $300.00 $31,800.00 0 NO BIDS 
 92324 RIDGE WALKER SORT 12 4 $364.00 $455.00 $351.52 $715.52 $178.88 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 92325 RIDGE WALKER SORT 13 38 $364.00 $481.00 $3,339.44 $7,785.44 $204.88 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 92326 RIDGE WALKER SORT 14 17 $364.00 $468.00 $1,493.96 $3,261.96 $191.88 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 92775 SHOWJUMPER SORT 1 225 $440.00 $448.72 $37,700.38 $39,662.38 $176.28 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92776 SHOWJUMPER SORT 2 439 $500.00 $558.66 $117,031.81 $142,783.55 $325.25 2 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92777 SHOWJUMPER SORT 3 1,170 $525.00 $530.00 $355,700.19 $361,550.19 $309.02 1 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92778 SHOWJUMPER SORT 4 1,079 $490.00 $526.80 $291,111.24 $330,818.44 $306.60 2 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc. 
 92779 SHOWJUMPER SORT 5 809 $550.00 $677.77 $269,750.74 $373,116.67 $461.21 4 Olympic Panel Products, LLC 
 92780 SHOWJUMPER SORT 6 798 $575.00 $725.00 $253,131.39 $372,831.39 $467.21 3 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 92781 SHOWJUMPER SORT 7 103 $400.00 $425.00 $15,669.11 $18,244.11 $177.13 1 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92782 SHOWJUMPER SORT 8 182 $600.00 $727.42 $65,947.20 $89,137.64 $489.77 3 Pacific Hardwoods 
 92783 SHOWJUMPER SORT 9 73 $425.00 $450.00 $16,594.16 $18,419.16 $252.32 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92784 SHOWJUMPER SORT 10 242 $1,200.00 $1,390.00 $233,437.38 $279,417.38 $1,154.62 3 Alta Forest Products LLC 
 92785 SHOWJUMPER SORT 11 69 $420.00 $532.50 $5,833.07 $13,595.57 $197.04 2 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 92786 SHOWJUMPER SORT 12 191 $420.00 $540.00 $7,207.82 $30,127.82 $157.74 3 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 


