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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 May 2016 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92364 CLAWED BEAR Clallam Ol 8431 $1,040,000.00 $1,295,074.00 $153.61 25% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 93206 RED AND BLUE Clallam Ol 4125 $684,000.00 $754,824.00 $182.99 10% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92969 YALE OF A TALE  Clark, Skamania PC 6152 $1,076,000.00 $1,476,569.16 $240.01 37% 4.00 Murphy Company 
 VRH VDT 
 93446 CASEY APB Cowlitz PC 2273 $550,000.00 $1,028,479.87 $452.48 87% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93181 LOST CREEK Jefferson Ol 1113 $151,000.00 $295,377.00 $265.39 96% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 93480 MAUDIFIED VDT Jefferson Ol 2566 $25,000.00 $31,421.43 $12.25 26% 1.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 93092 WING IT  Jefferson, Clallam Ol 5182 $1,157,000.00 $1,267,744.00 $244.64 10% 2.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. 
 HARDWOOD 
 92287 MULLIGAN VRH &  Mason SP 3263 $898,000.00 $1,356,874.20 $415.84 51% 4.00 Murphy Company 
 VDT 
 87265 ST PAUL Pacific PC 2892 $738,000.00 $945,294.76 $326.87 28% 5.00 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92530 WALNUT VDT and  Skagit NW 2621 $676,557.18 $1,007,078.40 $384.23 49% 1.86 See Sort Sales Results 
 VRH Sorts 
 93094 WEST BEAR  Skagit NW 4101 $1,208,000.00 $1,658,703.20 $404.46 37% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 TRIPPIN VRH & VDT 
 92630 PIG KNUCKLE  Snohomish NW 5244 $543,000.00 $1,169,920.27 $223.10 115% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 RIDGE 
 92649 GOLFER Snohomish NW 8200 $1,683,000.00 $2,997,982.64 $365.61 78% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93059 LOTTA STRANDS Snohomish NW 6026 $1,064,000.00 $1,978,985.52 $328.41 86% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92623 RIDGE LIFT Whatcom NW 2261 $376,000.00 $401,000.00 $177.36 7% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93007 49TH PARALLEL  Whatcom NW 1984 $447,000.00 NO BIDS 
 VRH & VDT 
 93091 EL DORADO VRH  Whatcom NW 1957 $590,000.00 NO BIDS 
 & VDT 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2016 17 15 0 2 68,391 64,432 0 3,959 94% $11,868,971.40 $17,665,328.45 $274.17 49% 2.59 
YTD FY 2016 108 105 0 3 455,332 443,209 0 12,123 98% $95,462,796.42 $132,829,437.59 $299.70 39% 2.55 
 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 
 
YTD FY 2016 8 7 0 1 12,226 12,102 0 124 99% $695,000.00 $1,175,527.67 $97.13 69% 1.71 
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2016 17 15 0 2 68,391 64,432 0 3,959 94% $11,868,971.40 $17,665,328.45 $274.17 49% 2.59 
YTD FY 2016 116 112 0 4 467,558 455,311 0 12,247 98% $96,157,796.42 $134,004,965.26 $294.32 39% 2.50 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 May 2016 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 93656 Walnut Sort 01 237 $600.00 $778.00 $78,718.00 $120,904.00 $510.14 2 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 93657 Walnut Sort 02 508 $540.00 $573.00 $149,414.72 $166,178.72 $327.12 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93658 Walnut Sort 03 447 $520.00 $585.00 $120,620.03 $149,675.03 $334.84 2 Great Western Lumber Co. 
 93659 Walnut Sort 04 389 $475.00 $522.00 $86,227.09 $104,510.09 $268.66 1 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93660 Walnut Sort 05 281 $1,000.00 $1,700.00 $142,760.21 $339,460.21 $1,208.04 3 Columbia Cedar, Inc. 
 93661 Walnut Sort 06 650 $415.00 $457.00 $107,505.75 $134,805.75 $207.39 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93662 Walnut Sort 07 91 $225.00 $234.00 ($9,274.40) ($8,455.40) ($92.92) 1 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 93663 Walnut Sort 08 18 $225.00 $585.78 0 NO BIDS 

 


