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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 May 2015 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 90792 STRIPED RIVER  Clallam Ol 3539 $1,176,540.36 $1,240,432.46 $350.50 5% 2.18 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 92059 RICOTTA Clark PC 10492 $2,354,000.00 $3,338,393.09 $318.18 42% 3.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92068 CATS MEOW Cowlitz PC 4917 $1,000,000.00 $1,051,034.00 $213.76 5% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 91881 GALWAY Lewis PC 3652 $885,000.00 $1,282,711.00 $351.24 45% 5.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. 

 90730 JEFFERSON Mason SP 4885 $1,644,000.00 $2,694,346.00 $551.55 64% 5.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. 

 91138 RECUR VRH and VDT Snohomish NW 3262 $581,000.00 $871,150.10 $267.06 50% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 91714 JUMBO RIDGE Stevens NE 3488 $773,000.00 $992,670.00 $284.60 28% 3.00 Potlatch Land & Lumber LLC 
 91745 MONUMENTAL  Stevens NE 4807 $637,720.41 Project Pending - See Sort Sales   
 SORTS Results 
 91631 SARATOGA Whatcom NW 1635 $304,000.00 NO BIDS 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2015 9 7 1 1 40,677 34,235 4,452 1,990 84% $8,413,540.36 $11,470,736.65 $335.06 36% 3.17 
YTD FY 2015 95 90 1 4 394,247 371,890 4,452 17,905 95% $103,840,313.80 $137,523,821.96 $369.80 32% 2.72 
 
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 91797 * NOW & LATER  King SP 1988 $219,000.00 $275,814.84 $138.74 26% 3.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 VRH & VDT 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2015 1 1 0 0 1,988 1,988 0 0 100% $219,000.00 $275,814.84 $138.74 26% 3.00 
YTD FY 2015 16 13 0 3 25,673 20,785 0 4,888 81% $2,272,000.00 $3,403,266.85 $163.74 50% 2.54 
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2015 10 8 1 1 42,665 36,223 4,452 1,990 85% $8,632,540.36 $11,746,551.49 $324.28 36% 3.15 
YTD FY 2015 111 103 1 7 419,920 392,675 4,452 22,793 94% $106,112,313.80 $140,927,088.81 $358.89 33% 2.69 



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 May 2015 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC® NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92117 STRIPED RIVER SORT 01 276 $600.00 $715.00 $92,863.62 $124,603.62 $451.46 3 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 92118 STRIPED RIVER SORT 02 304 $490.00 $490.00 $60,782.49 $60,782.49 $199.94 1 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 92119 STRIPED RIVER SORT 03 1,485 $500.00 $500.00 $405,378.85 $405,378.85 $272.98 4 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92120 STRIPED RIVER SORT 04 747 $530.00 $530.00 $291,540.94 $291,540.94 $390.28 2 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92121 STRIPED RIVER SORT 05 310 $483.80 $483.80 $96,087.10 $96,087.10 $309.96 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92122 STRIPED RIVER SORT 06 199 $1,050.00 $1,190.00 $180,296.47 $208,156.47 $1,046.01 3 Marys River Lumber Co. 
 92123 STRIPED RIVER SORT 07 61 $430.00 $430.00 $17,587.06 $17,587.06 $288.31 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92125 STRIPED RIVER SORT 09 28 $600.00 $600.00 $12,790.47 $12,790.47 $456.80 2 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 92126 STRIPED RIVER SORT 10 45 $450.00 $450.00 $13,768.76 $13,768.76 $305.97 2 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 92127 STRIPED RIVER SORT 11 25 $234.00 $318.60 $2,252.56 $4,367.56 $174.70 2 Evergreen Fibre 
 92128 STRIPED RIVER SORT 12 59 $198.00 $234.90 $3,192.04 $5,369.14 $91.00 3 Ryfield Properties, Inc. 
 92243 MONUMENTAL SORT 01 1,283 $420.00 $477.00 $158,445.41 $231,576.41 $180.50 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 92244 MONUMENTAL SORT 02 990 $400.00 $461.50 $143,189.67 $204,074.67 $206.14 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 92245 MONUMENTAL SORT 03 413 $372.06 $384.46 $34,627.11 $39,749.11 $96.24 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 92246 MONUMENTAL SORT 04 355 $344.59 $122,330.00 0 NO BIDS 
 92247 MONUMENTAL SORT 05 34 $360.00 $360.00 $624.28 $624.28 $18.36 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 92248 MONUMENTAL SORT 06 56 $385.00 $385.00 $6,310.98 $6,310.98 $112.70 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 92249 MONUMENTAL SORT 07 305 $814.00 $1,056.00 $177,268.45 $251,078.45 $823.21 2 Columbia Cedar, Inc. 
 92250 MONUMENTAL SORT 08 1,187 $287.97 $287.93 ($9,387.72) ($9,432.72) ($7.95) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 92251 MONUMENTAL SORT 09 184 $225.00 $225.00 $4,312.23 $4,312.23 $23.44 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 92295 MIDDLE MTN FIT SORT 01 1,106 $390.00 $475.20 $84,359.65 $178,590.85 $161.47 4 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 92296 MIDDLE MTN FIT SORT 02 1,563 $345.00 $487.50 $126,571.64 $349,299.14 $223.48 3 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 92297 MIDDLE MTN FIT SORT 03 50 $341.00 $341.00 $265.27 $265.27 $5.31 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 92298 MIDDLE MTN FIT SORT 04 19 $292.37 $5,555.00 0 NO BIDS 
 92299 MIDDLE MTN FIT SORT 05 29 $390.90 $11,336.00 0 NO BIDS 
 92300 MIDDLE MTN FIT SORT 06 584 $313.63 $313.63 ($18,936.44) ($18,936.44) ($32.43) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 92301 MIDDLE MTN FIT SORT 07 139 $207.00 $207.00 ($12,993.94) ($12,993.94) ($93.48) 2 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS 
 May 2015 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    TREATMENT  VOLUME TOTAL     
 NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION ACRES OFFERED MINIMUM  TOTAL BID PRICETOTAL REVENUE NET $ / MBF 
  MBF BID 
MIDDLE MTN FIT SORTS  Okanogan NE 757 3,490 Project Pending - See Sort Sales Results 
 

 PROJECTS  PROJECTS  NOT  TREATMENT  VOLUME  VOLUME  
 OFFERED AWARDED AWARDED ACRES OFFERED AWARDED 
May 2015 0 0 0 0 0 0 
YTD FY 2015 5 5 0 3,997 23,487 23,487 


