
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
BOARD SALE RESULTS 

May 2017

VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 

 MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

94666 RAINEY CLARK Clallam OLY 817 $173,000.00 $264,506.58 $323.75 53% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc.
93220 COMMITMENT Grays Harbor SP 7267 $2,213,000.00 $2,292,115.00 $315.41 4% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
94753 SOHO VDT VRH Jefferson OLY 4095 $659,000.00 $1,337,945.15 $326.73 103% 3.00 Western Timber, Inc.
93097 CENTER 16 Jefferson, Clallam OLY 4659 $242,000.00 $908,708.91 $195.04 275% 1.00 Interfor U.S., Inc.

THINNING 
93652 RADAR LOVE Jefferson, Clallam OLY 7837 $2,236,000.00 $3,734,872.00 $476.57 67% 4.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
93068 PEEL OUT King SP 2835 $511,000.00 $844,452.88 $297.87 65% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
93212 SCORPION VRH & Mason SP 4830 $1,594,000.00 $1,841,644.80 $381.29 16% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries

VDT 
94695 TILLMAN FH Okanogan NE 6494 $445,000.00 $1,007,766.10 $155.18 126% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
93719 BOLERO Skagit NW 4551 $1,146,000.00 $1,813,109.58 $398.40 58% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
95109 SWIFT MITCHELL Skamania PC 7946 $1,325,000.00 $1,334,052.81 $167.89 1% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.

VRH VDT 
89642 SINGLETARY Snohomish NW 5711 $956,000.00 $1,731,121.20 $303.12 81% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
93899 AMERICAN ROYAL Snohomish NW 2462 $608,000.00 $965,453.00 $392.14 59% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
94393 TURNING WHEEL Snohomish NW 4535 $1,224,000.00 $2,168,922.00 $478.26 77% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
94521 DOWNRIGGER Snohomish NW 2090 $534,000.00 $689,460.79 $329.89 29% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries

SUPREME VRH & 
VDT 

94741 JAGUAR Snohomish NW 3774 $1,204,000.00 $1,815,296.93 $481.00 51% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94483 OH JOY Stevens NE 6352 $1,057,000.00 $1,382,469.72 $217.64 31% 1.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
92624 CLEARWATER Whatcom NW 3994 $660,000.00 $864,402.67 $216.43 31% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.

REVIVAL VRH VDT 
 RMZ 

93614 TENNESSEE JED Whatcom NW 3929 $1,113,000.00 $1,488,168.57 $378.77 34% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2017 18 18 0 0 84,178 84,178 0 0 100% $17,900,000.00 $26,484,468.69 $314.62 48% 2.17
YTD FY 2017 121 120 0 1 498,331 497,738 0 593 100% $127,838,538.00 $170,480,180.48 $342.51 33% 2.67 
RESOURCES 

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

May 2017 18 18 0 0 84,178 84,178 0 0 100% $17,900,000.00 $26,484,468.69 $314.62 48% 2.17
YTD FY 2017 121 120 0 1 498,331 497,738 0 593 100% $127,838,538.00 $170,480,180.48 $342.51 33% 2.67




