
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 March 2022 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102167 UPPER COUGAR Clark PC 3078 $1,291,000.00 $1,611,808.64 $523.65 25% 4.00 High Cascade, Inc. 
 102255 GOODMAN 1 Jefferson OLY 3823 $1,007,000.00 $1,380,282.00 $361.05 37% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 101630 Q HARVARD Okanogan NE 4694 $674,000.00 NO BIDS 
 102044 PIVOT Pacific PC 10333 $4,052,000.00 $5,887,296.00 $569.76 45% 4.00 Manke Timber Company, Inc. 
 100672 * VESPA VRH & VDT Pierce SP 6487 $3,018,000.00 $4,273,923.41 $658.84 42% 4.00 Rainier Veneer, Inc. 
 102568  ARCHANGEL Skagit NW 2296 $992,000.00 $2,200,664.00 $958.48 122% 7.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 101888 Q GLENWATER Yakima SE 3755 $1,036,000.00 $2,009,546.00 $535.17 94% 5.00 Yakama Forest Products 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

March 2022 7 6 0 1 34,466 29,772 0 4,694 86% $11,396,000.00 $17,363,520.05 $583.22 52% 4.50 
YTD FY 2022 67 65 0 2 297,645 292,488 0 5,157 98% $96,592,399.92 $131,314,813.84 $448.96 36% 2.94 

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102990 Q BLACK BIRD  Okanogan NE 5208 $75,000.00 $92,544.76 $17.77 23% 1.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 SALVAGE 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

March 2022 1 1 0 0 5,208 5,208 0 0 100% $75,000.00 $92,544.76 $17.77 23% 1.00 
YTD FY 2022 11 10 0 1 18,924 17,050 0 1,874 90% $852,210.00 $1,700,436.90 $99.73 100% 2.00 
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

March 2022 8 7 0 1 39,674 34,980 0 4,694 88% $11,471,000.00 $17,456,064.81 $499.03 52% 4.00 
YTD FY 2022 78 75 0 3 316,569 309,538 0 7,031 98% $97,444,609.92 $133,015,250.74 $429.72 37% 2.82 


