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 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 June 2020 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 99247 HOT LEAD SORTS Clallam OLY 4925 $471,716.26 $887,791.26 $180.26 88% 2.20 See Sort Sales Results 
 99254 BITTEN Clallam OLY 2875 $342,000.00 $693,781.00 $241.32 103% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 99255 SOUTH CHICAGO Clallam OLY 8984 $1,282,000.00 $1,602,720.00 $178.40 25% 2.00 Webster Logging 
 100403 NO PROMISES Grays Harbor OLY 5942 $1,184,000.00 $2,557,864.00 $430.47 116% 4.00 Harbor Timber 
 99922 ICONIC SORTS Pacific, Lewis PC 155 $45,702.36 $48,802.36 $314.85 7% 1.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 99988 Q BOYCE Pend Oreille NE 5582 $1,043,000.00 $1,282,640.00 $229.78 23% 2.00 IFG Timber, LLC 
 98732 CREEDENCE Snohomish NW 4202 $388,000.00 $1,189,864.00 $283.17 207% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 98161 Q BROOKS  Stevens NE 6631 $1,211,000.00 $1,615,183.44 $243.58 33% 3.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 JUNCTION 
 99451 Q LITTLE HARVEY  Stevens NE 3424 $231,310.15 $293,300.69 $85.66 27% 1.56 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 99855 Q COMSTOCK Stevens NE 286 $2,443.13 $2,554.67 $8.93 5% 1.00 See Sort Sales Results 
  SORTS 
 100007 Q COUSINS Stevens NE 6991 $1,256,000.00 NO BIDS 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2020 11 10 0 1 49,997 42,927 0 7,070 86% $6,181,263.90 $10,174,501.42 $237.02 65% 2.18 
YTD FY 2020 119 112 0 7 560,524 525,273 0 35,251 95% $117,344,923.49 $153,801,013.29 $292.80 31% 2.50   

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100535 * MISSION CREEK Mason SP 215 $45,000.00 $91,992.00 $427.87 104% 5.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2020 1 1 0 0 215 215 0 0 100% $45,000.00 $91,992.00 $427.87 104% 5.00 
YTD FY 2020 9 9 0 0 8,624 8,624 0 0 100% $970,000.00 $1,510,149.39 $175.11 56% 2.56   

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2020 12 11 0 1 50,212 43,142 0 7,070 86% $6,226,263.90 $10,266,493.42 $237.97 65% 2.43 
YTD FY 2020 128 121 0 7 569,148 533,897 0 35,251 95% $118,314,923.49 $155,311,162.68 $290.90 31% 2.50 
 
 



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 June 2020 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 99930 ICONIC SORT 8 155 $500.00 $520.00 $45,702.36 $48,802.36 $314.85 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 100088 Q COMSTOCK SORT 08 286 $300.00 $300.39 $2,443.13 $2,554.67 $8.93 1 C & C Timber, Inc. 
 100500 HOT LEAD SORT 01 127 $530.00 $678.00 $26,404.28 $45,200.28 $355.91 4 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 100501 HOT LEAD SORT 02 265 $530.00 $585.00 $47,177.34 $61,752.34 $233.03 1 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100502 HOT LEAD SORT 03 362 $500.00 $650.00 $59,381.65 $113,681.65 $314.04 4 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 100503 HOT LEAD SORT 04 405 $500.00 $590.00 $90,913.47 $127,363.47 $314.48 2 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 100504 HOT LEAD SORT 05 877 $440.00 $460.00 $126,742.02 $144,282.02 $164.52 3 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 100505 HOT LEAD SORT 06 2,282 $400.00 $515.00 $54,169.42 $316,599.42 $138.74 1 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 100506 HOT LEAD SORT 07 52 $750.00 $1,265.00 $16,738.16 $43,518.16 $836.89 3 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 100507 HOT LEAD SORT 08 189 $400.00 $425.00 $16,701.49 $21,426.49 $113.37 1 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 100508 HOT LEAD SORT 09 115 $450.00 $450.00 $19,772.83 $19,772.83 $171.94 2 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 100509 HOT LEAD SORT 10 172 $252.00 $254.25 ($6,192.40) ($5,805.40) ($33.75) 1 Evergreen Fibre 
 100620 Q LITTLE HARVEY SORT 01 617 $402.00 $436.80 $77,812.01 $99,283.61 $160.91 3 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100621 Q LITTLE HARVEY SORT 02 695 $400.00 $410.00 $112,196.26 $119,146.26 $171.43 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 100622 Q LITTLE HARVEY SORT 03 21 $321.90 $383.81 $809.90 $2,109.90 $100.47 2 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100623 Q LITTLE HARVEY SORT 04 30 $318.00 $318.00 $1,053.01 $1,053.01 $35.10 1 IFG Timber, LLC 
 100624 Q LITTLE HARVEY SORT 05 565 $300.04 $352.54 ($30,251.79) ($585.79) ($1.04) 2 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100625 Q LITTLE HARVEY SORT 06 1,007 $302.47 $305.06 $46,449.63 $49,052.57 $48.71 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 100626 Q LITTLE HARVEY SORT 07 23 $698.22 $698.22 $11,070.15 $11,070.15 $481.31 1 Columbia Cedar, Inc. 
 100627 Q LITTLE HARVEY SORT 08 445 $320.00 $320.00 $12,667.14 $12,667.14 $28.47 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100628 Q LITTLE HARVEY SORT 09 21 $225.00 $225.00 ($496.16) ($496.16) ($23.63) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100690 HOT LEAD SORT 11 79 $252.00 $19,908.00 0 NO BIDS 
 


