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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 June 2021 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100656 SHU TYE Clallam OLY 1787 $247,000.00 $265,888.78 $148.79 8% 2.00 Harbor Timber 
 100660 CHRISTMAS BLOCK Jefferson OLY 6736 $1,549,000.00 $1,994,198.00 $296.05 29% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 99066 * CROW BAIT Lewis SP 4342 $1,450,000.00 $2,005,892.00 $461.97 38% 5.00 Rainier Veneer, Inc. 
 101611 Q UPPER COXIT Okanogan NE 3028 $437,000.00 $438,500.00 $144.82 0% 1.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 101453 Q GRANDE Stevens NE 2915 $808,000.00 $808,808.00 $277.46 0% 1.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 101503 Q BLUE HILL  Stevens NE 2259 $578,387.93 $639,482.93 $283.08 11% 1.43 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 100460 OYSTER VRH RMZ Whatcom NW 3290 $969,000.00 $1,621,066.00 $492.73 67% 4.00 Nielsen Brothers, Inc. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2021 7 7 0 0 24,357 24,330 0 27 100% $6,036,696.62 $7,773,835.71 $319.52 29% 2.49 
YTD FY 2021 108 107 1 0 531,667 530,526 0 1,141 100% $153,475,417.68 $212,465,973.07 $400.48 38% 2.48 
   
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2021 7 7 0 0 24,357 24,330 0 27 100% $6,036,696.62 $7,773,835.71 $319.52 29% 2.49 
YTD FY 2021 115 113 1 1 542,484 541,097 0 1,387 100% $154,184,417.68 $214,220,441.47 $395.90 39% 2.48 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

 June 2021 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 101905 Q BLUE HILL SORT 01 396 $525.00 $547.50 $90,287.91 $99,197.91 $250.50 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 DF/WL 7-10" dib  
 101906 Q BLUE HILL SORT 02 683 $525.00 $585.00 $183,918.08 $224,898.08 $329.28 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC  
 DF/WL 11"+ dib  
 101907 Q BLUE HILL SORT 03 5 $421.60 $421.60 $654.57 $654.57 $130.91 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 GF & non-chuckable DF/WL 7-10" dib 
 101908 Q BLUE HILL SORT 04 4 $420.00 $726.93 0 NO BIDS 
 GF & non-chuckable DF/WL 11"+ dib 
 101909 Q BLUE HILL SORT 05 269 $345.09 $350.11 $3,381.36 $4,733.42 $17.60 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 PP 6-10" dib  
 101910 Q BLUE HILL SORT 06 484 $363.00 $363.00 $44,010.01 $44,010.01 $90.93 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 PP 11"+ dib  
 101911 Q BLUE HILL SORT 07 172 $1,408.37 $1,475.49 $202,212.73 $213,756.98 $1,242.77 2 Columbia Cedar, Inc. 
 WRC 5"+ dib 
 101912 Q BLUE HILL SORT 08 223 $332.75 $332.75 $52,231.96 $52,231.96 $234.22 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 DF/WL/GF 5-6" dib 
 101913 Q BLUE HILL SORT 09 23 $225.00 $964.38 0 NO BIDS 
 All conifer species except WRC 2"+  
 


