AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE

102250

102262
102028
102256
103111
101109
102796
102002

102895
100355

101670

102558
102772

102946

June 2022
YTD FY 2022

SALES
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID

COUNTY
TREES A CROWD Clallam
VDT
TYEE RIDGE Clallam
T3 CAMP RUN Jefferson
T3 H-1500 Jefferson
BOLTON REHAB Jefferson
HOLDING WOOD Mason
CREEK CRICK Pacific
Q BOYER EAST Pend Oreille
SORTS
YETIS YARD Skamania
BLUE DUNE Snohomish
BUGGY VRH VDT
TIMBER TOE VDT  Snohomish
VRH
CALIPER Snohomish
Q LAST GEM SORTS Stevens
WATCHMEN Thurston

SALES SALES SALES

AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE

YTD FY 2022

June 2022
YTD FY 2022

SALES
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID

14 13
106 102

0
0

14 13 0 1
94 91 0 3
COUNTY
12 11 0 1
SALES  SALES SALES

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

BOARD SALE RESULTS
June 2022
VOLUME
REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
OLY 3638 $706,000.00 $782,403.68 $215.06 11% 1.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.
OLY 3591 $1,154,000.00 $1,158,001.00 $322.47 0% 1.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.
OLY 4325 $1,034,000.00 $1,359,781.00 $314.40 32% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
OLY 4695 $908,000.00 NO BIDS
OLY 1149 $489,000.00 $558,538.00 $486.11 14% 1.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.
SP 1627 $753,000.00 $1,150,436.20 $707.09 53% 3.00 Stella-Jones Corporation
PC 5634 $1,831,000.00 $1,832,000.00 $325.17 0% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
NE 284 $348,200.02 $348,200.02 $1,226.06 0% 1.00 See Sort Sales Results
PC 7977 $2,552,000.00 $2,935,283.93 $367.97 15% 2.00 High Cascade, Inc.
NW 2524 $922,000.00 $977,389.74 $387.24 6% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
NW 7832 $1,815,000.00 $2,191,102.88 $279.76 21% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
NW 4302 $1,486,000.00 $2,261,089.17 $525.59 52% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
NE 4184 $1,535,741.44 $1,641,765.08 $392.39 7% 1.20 See Sort Sales Results
SP 6760 $2,623,000.00 $2,726,163.00 $403.28 4% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES
VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE %
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER
58,522 53,827 0 4,695 92% $17,248,941.46 $19,922,153.70 $370.11 15%
422,013 411,742 0 10,271 98% $134,987,331.89 $177,859,229.78 $431.97 32%
REGIONAL SALE RESULTS
VOLUME
REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
19,393 17,519 0 1,874 90% $966,210.00 $1,815,436.90 $103.63 88%
SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES
VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE %
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER
58,522 53,827 0 4,695 92% $17,248,941.46 $19,922,153.70 $370.11 15%
441,406 429,261 0 12,145 98% $135,953,541.89 $179,674,666.68 $418.57 32%

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

AVG #
BIDS

1.63
2.67

AVG #
BIDS

1.63
2.58



AGREE-
MENT

103142

103143

103323

103324

103325

103326

103327

103328

103329

103330

103331

103332

FSC

VOLUME
NAME OF SALE OFFERED

MBF
Q BOYER EAST SORT 06 50
PP 11"+ dib
Q BOYER EAST SORT 07 234
WRC Poles 35+
Q LAST GEM SORT 01 652
DL/WL 7-10" dib
Q LAST GEM SORT 02 700
DF/WL 11"+ dib
Q LAST GEM SORT 03 515
ES/GF/WH/LP & non-chuckable
Q LAST GEM SORT 04 293
ES/GF/WH/LP & non-chuckable
Q LAST GEM SORT 05 48
PP 6-10" dib
Q LAST GEM SORT 06 9
PP 11"+ dib
Q LAST GEM SORT 07 164
WRC Poles 35"+
Q LAST GEM SORT 08 1,111
WRC 5"+ dib
Q LAST GEM SORT 09 605
DF/WL/ES/GF/WH/LP 5-6" dib
Q LAST GEM SORT 10 87

All conifer species except WRC 2"+

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

Delivered Values

MINIMUM

BID / MBF
$335.50

$1,697.24
$504.00
$500.00
$440.20
$397.53
$322.50
$327.78
$1,697.56
$1,407.88
$332.80

$225.00

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)

Stumpage Determination (Projected)

June 2022
TOTAL
BID MINIMUM
PRICE / MBF BID
$335.50 $2,667.13
$1,697.24 $345,532.89
$554.10 $64,829.66
$520.00 $108,998.40
$446.90 $20,666.95
$397.53 ($29,835.55)
$322.50 (88,279.42)
$327.78 ($449.99)
$1,697.56 $215,929.57
$1,452.98 $1,218,978.87
$342.40 ($47,669.16)
$225.00 ($7,427.89)

TOTAL BID

PRICE
$2,667.13

$345,532.89
$97,494.86
$122,998.40
$24,115.39
($29,835.55)
($8,279.42)
($449.99)
$215,929.57
$1,269,080.87
($41,861.16)

($7,427.89)

PRICE

/MBF
$53.34

$1,476.64
$149.53
$175.71
$46.83
($101.83)
($172.49)
(850.00)
$1,316.64
$1,142.29
(369.19)

($85.38)

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

IFG Timber, LLC
Bell Timber, Inc.

Boise Cascade Wood Products,
LLC

Boise Cascade Wood Products,
LLC

Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.

IFG Timber, LLC

Boise Cascade Wood Products,
LLC

Boise Cascade Wood Products,
LLC

Bell Timber, Inc.

Columbia Cedar, Inc.

Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.

Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.



