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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 July 2017 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 95897 SPLINTER DECKS Cowlitz PC 323 $96,000.00 $129,823.39 $401.93 35% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 94971 SAND DOLLAR Grays Harbor OLY 2363 $562,000.00 $753,010.00 $318.67 34% 4.00 WT Timber, LLC 
 95011 ALOHA Grays Harbor OLY 2884 $632,000.00 $935,043.00 $324.22 48% 4.00 Harbor Timber 
 94784 LIMEBLACKER Stevens NE 1149 $369,925.00 $384,191.20 $334.37 4% 1.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 93728 CLEAR BACK VRH  Whatcom NW 3211 $321,000.00 $322,389.87 $100.40 0% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 VDT 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2017 5 5 0 0 9,930 9,930 0 0 100% $1,980,925.00 $2,524,457.46 $254.23 27% 2.40 
YTD FY 2018 5 5 0 0 9,930 9,930 0 0 100% $1,980,925.00 $2,524,457.46 $254.23 27% 2.40  

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2017 5 5 0 0 9,930 9,930 0 0 100% $1,980,925.00 $2,524,457.46 $254.23 27% 2.40 
YTD FY 2018 5 5 0 0 9,930 9,930 0 0 100% $1,980,925.00 $2,524,457.46 $254.23 27% 2.40 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 July 2017 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 95287 MILAN FIT SORT 01 391 $384.00 $463.56 $21,187.41 $52,295.37 $133.75 3 IFG Timber, LLC 
 95288 MILAN FIT SORT 02 520 $432.00 $457.55 $75,031.57 $88,317.57 $169.84 2 IFG Timber, LLC 
 95289 MILAN FIT SORT 03 70 $322.40 $424.45 ($829.71) $6,313.93 $90.20 2 IFG Timber, LLC 
 95290 MILAN FIT SORT 04 164 $317.93 $318.19 $4,727.84 $4,771.29 $29.09 1 IFG Timber, LLC 
 95291 MILAN FIT SORT 05 510 $352.50 $352.50 ($24,601.30) ($24,601.30) ($48.24) 2 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 95292 MILAN FIT SORT 06 484 $352.00 $388.02 $4,667.99 $22,104.09 $45.67 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 95293 MILAN FIT SORT 07 224 $1,100.45 $1,279.82 $188,891.81 $229,071.31 $1,022.64 2 IFG Timber, LLC 
 95294 MILAN FIT SORT 08 331 $320.09 $326.34 ($8,365.81) ($6,297.81) ($19.03) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 95295 MILAN FIT SORT 09 33 $225.00 $225.00 ($4,249.19) ($4,249.19) ($128.76) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS 
 July 2017 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    TREATMENT  VOLUME TOTAL     
 NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION ACRES OFFERED MINIMUM  TOTAL BID PRICETOTAL REVENUE NET $ / MBF 
  MBF BID 

 MILAN FIT SORTS Spokane NE 1,146 2,727 $1,159,510.00 $1,270,774.65 $367,725.26 $134.85 
 PROJECTS  PROJECTS  NOT  TREATMENT  VOLUME  VOLUME  
 OFFERED AWARDED AWARDED ACRES OFFERED AWARDED 

July 2017 1 1 0 1,146 2,727 2,727 
YTD FY 2018 1 1 0 1,146 2,727 2,727 

 


