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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 January 2015 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 90791 HAPPY CAT Clallam Ol 3198 $1,264,000.00 $1,556,065.42 $486.57 23% 2.00 Murphy Company 
 90743 RIB ROAST VRH  Cowlitz PC 4424 $1,029,000.00 NO BIDS 
 AND THIN 
 91490 MUSTANG Cowlitz PC 7371 $2,906,000.00 $3,788,294.32 $513.95 30% 5.00 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 91233 DAVIS NORTH Grays Harbor PC 3359 $821,000.00 $910,821.00 $271.16 11% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 90553 TRAINING King SP 4662 $1,532,000.00 $2,036,360.00 $436.80 33% 4.00 A & W Timber Brokers, Inc. 
 90551 * FORGOTTEN TOP Lewis SP 3945 $1,213,000.00 $1,969,049.50 $499.13 62% 7.00 Pulley Corporation 
 91466 ICE Okanogan NE 3049 $300,000.00 $715,022.42 $234.51 138% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 90613 DAY Skagit NW 5041 $1,828,000.00 $2,441,583.09 $484.34 34% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 91017 SERFS SAUCER Skagit NW 6070 $2,138,000.00 $3,085,864.85 $508.38 44% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 91018 GABRIELLES HORN Skagit NW 2390 $737,000.00 $740,725.64 $309.93 1% 1.00 Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc. 

 91656 LOST AGAIN Skagit NW 3318 $1,432,000.00 $1,911,021.69 $575.96 33% 3.00 Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc. 
 91616 HAPPY TUM Stevens, Spokane NE 4181 $474,000.00 $687,346.47 $164.40 45% 2.00 IFG Timber, LLC 
 90746 * NORTH ZONE THIN Thurston, Grays  SP 2513 $494,000.00 $528,231.32 $210.20 7% 2.00 Pulley Corporation 
 Harbor 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2015 13 12 0 1 53,521 49,097 0 4,424 92% $15,139,000.00 $20,370,385.72 $414.90 35% 2.92 
YTD FY 2015 53 52 0 1 203,668 198,678 0 4,990 98% $53,632,037.39 $75,655,297.61 $380.79 41% 2.85 
  
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

None Offered 

YTD FY 2015 10 9 0 1 16,042 12,621 0 3,421 79% $1,542,000.00 $1,886,161.23 $149.45 22% 2.11  
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2015 13 12 0 1 53,521 49,097 0 4,424 92% $15,139,000.00 $20,370,385.72 $414.90 35% 2.92 
YTD FY 2015 63 61 0 2 219,710 211,299 0 8,411 97% $55,174,037.39 $77,541,458.84 $366.98 41% 2.74 



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 January 2015 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92167 CARLTON FIRE SALVAGE FIT  1,347 $401.47 $421.60 $211,093.69 $238,206.97 $176.84 2 Omak Wood Products, LLC 
 SORT 01 
 92168 CARLTON FIRE SALVAGE FIT  948 $400.10 $416.85 $116,052.51 $131,927.19 $139.16 3 Omak Wood Products, LLC 
 SORT 02 
 92169 CARLTON FIRE SALVAGE FIT  2,013 $337.51 $356.26 ($273,561.27) ($235,816.27) ($117.15) 2 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 SORT 03 
 92170 CARLTON FIRE SALVAGE FIT  827 $387.05 $390.20 $2,116.29 $4,721.69 $5.71 1 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 SORT 04 
 92171 CARLTON FIRE SALVAGE FIT  2,175 $176.39 $201.97 ($220,369.84) ($164,739.72) ($75.74) 2 Omak Wood Products, LLC 
 SORT 05 
 92172 CARLTON FIRE SALVAGE FIT  47 $296.43 $4,001.30 0 NO BIDS 
 SORT 06 



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS 
 January 2015 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    TREATMENT VOLUME TOTAL     
 NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION  ACRES OFFERED MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  TOTAL REVENUE NET $ / MBF 
  MBF BID PRICE 

 CARLTON FIRE SALVAGE FIT Okanogan NE 1,241 7,357 $2,317,173.00 $2,442,209.48 ($25,700.14) ($3.49) 
 PROJECTS  PROJECTS  NOT AWARDED TREATMENT  VOLUME  VOLUME  
 OFFERED AWARDED ACRES OFFERED AWARDED 
January 2015 0 0 0 0 0 0 
YTD FY 2015 3 3 0 2,212 12,120 12,120 


