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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 February 2023 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 103291 UPPER JONES Clark PC 3260 $930,000.00 $1,667,388.00 $511.47 79% 4.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 103772 MALARKEY Cowlitz PC 3377 $801,000.00 $1,392,053.00 $412.22 74% 5.00 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 102256 T3 H-1500 Jefferson OLY 6160 $630,000.00 $631,036.00 $102.44 0% 1.00 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 103254 NAME THAT  Lewis PC 3507 $1,236,000.00 $2,042,742.62 $582.48 65% 4.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 HARMONY 
 102174 * KITTY KAT Pierce SP 3290 $1,248,000.00 $2,062,182.88 $626.80 65% 5.00 Chehalis Valley Timber, Inc. 
 101720 CADDIS Sorts Skagit NW 2016 $1,036,056.43 Project Pending - See Sort Sales  
 Results 
 102088 HOPSCOTCH Thurston SP 9731 $3,628,000.00 $4,296,645.00 $441.54 18% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 103222 FIR REALS SORTS Wahkiakum PC 6233 $1,810,823.37 $1,879,658.69 $301.57 4% 1.70 See Sort Sales Results 
 103065 WEST BELL Whatcom NW 7366 $1,425,000.00 $2,353,189.00 $319.47 65% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

February 2023 9 8 1 0 44,940 42,795 156 1,989 96% $11,650,128.37 $16,324,895.19 $381.47 40% 3.21 
YTD FY 2023 65 63 1 1 279,962 272,811 156 6,995 97% $81,488,206.71 $113,780,965.81 $417.07 40% 3.01 
  
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 103286 RED ADDER Whatcom NW 1677 $195,000.00 $511,280.00 $304.88 162% 4.00 Frank Harkness Trucking and Logging 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

February 2023 1 1 0 0 1,677 1,677 0 0 100% $195,000.00 $511,280.00 $304.88 162% 4.00 
YTD FY 2023 12 10 0 2 14,218 13,992 0 226 98% $1,291,890.00 $2,908,509.48 $207.87 125% 2.60 
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

February 2023 10 9 1 0 46,617 44,472 156 1,989 96% $11,845,128.37 $16,836,175.19 $378.58 42% 3.30 
YTD FY 2023 77 73 1 3 294,180 286,803 156 7,221 98% $82,780,096.71 $116,689,475.29 $406.86 41% 2.95 



 Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
 * If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 February 2023 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 102606 CADDIS Sort 01 407 $800.00 $264,285.45 0 NO BIDS 
 DF Sawlog 20"+ 
 102607 CADDIS Sort 02 318 $875.00 $228,902.76 0 NO BIDS 
 DF Sawlog 12"-19" 
 102608 CADDIS Sort 03 69 $875.00 $49,980.15 0 NO BIDS 
 DF Sawlog 5"-11" 
 102609 CADDIS Sort 04 49 $450.00 $451.99 $10,182.69 $10,280.20 $209.80 1 Fritch Forest Products, Inc. 
 WW Sawlog 20"+ 
 102610 CADDIS Sort 05 694 $600.00 $307,809.82 0 NO BIDS 
 WW Sawlog 12"-19" 
 102611 CADDIS Sort 06 282 $600.00 $125,075.46 0 NO BIDS 
 WW Sawlog 5"-11" 
 102612 CADDIS Sort 07 90 $1,200.00 $1,301.99 $86,748.30 $95,927.40 $1,065.86 3 Fritch Forest Products, Inc. 
 RC Sawlog 5"+ 
 102613 CADDIS Sort 08 17 $100.00 $100.00 ($2,794.80) ($2,794.80) ($164.40) 1 Fritch Forest Products, Inc. 
 BC Sawlog 12"+ 
 102614 CADDIS Sort 09 90 $252.00 ($34,133.40) 0 NO BIDS 
 Conifer Utility 
 103223 FIR REALS SORT 1 304 $750.00 $750.10 $140,938.77 $140,969.17 $463.71 2 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 DF 5"-11" 
 103224 FIR REALS SORT 2 598 $750.00 $775.81 $278,114.48 $293,548.86 $490.88 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 DF 12"-19" 
 103225 FIR REALS SORT 3 453 $800.00 $840.00 $238,995.72 $257,115.72 $567.58 1 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc. 
 DF 20"+ 
 103226 FIR REALS SORT 4 832 $850.00 $880.00 $479,318.84 $504,278.84 $606.10 2 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc. 
 DF HQ 12"+ 
 103227 FIR REALS SORT 5 671 $525.00 $589.18 $82,676.84 $125,741.62 $187.39 2 Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc. 
 WW 5"-11" 
 103228 FIR REALS SORT 6 1,717 $550.00 $553.91 $298,301.92 $305,015.39 $177.64 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 WW 12"-19" 
 103229 FIR REALS SORT 7 1,229 $500.00 $501.01 $193,843.26 $195,084.55 $158.73 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 WW 20"+ 
 103230 FIR REALS SORT 8 136 $264.00 $357.50 ($11,257.49) $1,458.51 $10.72 2 Alta Forest Products, LLC 
 SS 12"+ 
 103231 FIR REALS SORT 9 35 $1,200.00 $1,350.00 $31,486.85 $36,736.85 $1,049.62 2 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 RC 5"+ 
 103232 FIR REALS SORT 10 129 $500.00 $500.00 $19,709.18 $19,709.18 $152.78 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 RA 5"+ 
 103233 FIR REALS SORT 11 115 $455.00 $52,325.00 0 NO BIDS 
 Conifer Pulp 2"+ 
 103234 FIR REALS SORT 12 14 $455.00 $6,370.00 0 NO BIDS 
 Hardwood Pulp 2"+ 


