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* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 December 2017 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 95563 TIMBER TIME THIN Clallam OLY 3396 $573,000.00 $1,145,128.42 $337.20 100% 1.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 95278 WOOLFORD Cowlitz PC 1926 $740,000.00 $1,191,543.00 $618.66 61% 5.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 94505 BLUE RIDGE 2018 Grays Harbor,  SP 2009 $848,000.00 $1,357,452.08 $675.69 60% 5.00 Murphy Company 
 Thurston 
 95530 MAIN TIME Jefferson OLY 2524 $686,000.00 $1,432,056.00 $567.38 109% 1.00 Harbor Timber 
 94091 * PYRITE Kitsap SP 4008 $1,381,000.00 $2,161,317.65 $539.25 57% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 95603 BE MY GUEST Lewis PC 6077 $2,662,000.00 $3,714,587.00 $611.25 40% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 95699 LINCOLN SALVAGE Lewis PC 361 $81,000.00 $126,895.11 $351.51 57% 4.00 Double Mountain Development, LLC 
 95125 CAT FAN SORTS Pacific PC 6296 $2,384,627.42 $3,379,004.42 $536.69 42% 2.69 See Sort Sales Results 
 95191 ODDFELLOWS Pacific PC 1691 $446,000.00 $694,155.56 $410.50 56% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 95539 SUNSET Pacific PC 4533 $1,609,000.00 $2,233,400.00 $492.70 39% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 95142 YOCUM Pend Oreille NE 5360 $908,000.00 $1,226,000.00 $228.73 35% 4.00 Potlatch Land & Lumber, LLC 
 95064 JUG BAND VRH  Skagit NW 5481 $2,453,388.58 Project Pending - See Sort Sales  
 RMZ SORTS Results 
 95076 TITAN VRH RMZ Skagit NW 3943 $1,869,000.00 $2,309,615.53 $585.75 24% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 95622 JAMBOREE VRH  Skagit NW 1942 $888,000.00 $1,213,304.18 $624.77 37% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 RMZ 
 95848 WAGONEAST Skagit NW 3312 $1,467,000.00 $2,010,729.96 $607.10 37% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 95241 HAWK PORTAL Snohomish NW 2469 $805,000.00 $970,013.00 $392.88 20% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 95171 TIGER STRIPES Stevens NE 6509 $1,223,000.00 $1,708,563.00 $262.49 40% 3.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 94760 SHASTA Thurston SP 10264 $3,810,000.00 $6,122,107.00 $596.46 61% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 94954 MARINARA Whatcom NW 1510 $551,000.00 $766,335.11 $507.51 39% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2017 19 18 1 0 73,611 68,130 5,435 46 93% $22,931,627.42 $33,762,207.02 $495.56 47% 2.76 
YTD FY 2018 54 52 1 1 221,884 209,296 5,435 7,153 94% $66,411,082.56 $97,487,356.33 $465.79 47% 2.77      
  

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2017 19 18 1 0 73,611 68,130 5,435 46 93% $22,931,627.42 $33,762,207.02 $495.56 47% 2.76 
YTD FY 2018 54 52 1 1 221,884 209,296 5,435 7,153 94% $66,411,082.56 $97,487,356.33 $465.79 47% 2.77 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 December 2017 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 95126 CAT FAN SORT 1 363 $650.00 $785.00 $141,681.43 $190,686.43 $525.31 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 95127 CAT FAN SORT 2 1,148 $675.00 $810.00 $494,359.77 $649,339.77 $565.63 4 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 95128 CAT FAN SORT 3 1,194 $625.00 $730.00 $435,209.39 $560,579.39 $469.50 4 C&D Lumber 
 95129 CAT FAN SORT 4 670 $700.00 $875.00 $289,973.97 $407,223.97 $607.80 3 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 95130 CAT FAN SORT 5 633 $500.00 $685.00 $143,733.40 $260,838.40 $412.07 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 95131 CAT FAN SORT 6 692 $520.00 $710.00 $187,972.79 $319,452.79 $461.64 4 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 95132 CAT FAN SORT 7 343 $450.00 $610.10 $48,982.79 $103,897.09 $302.91 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 95134 CAT FAN SORT 9 551 $720.00 $863.55 $252,499.59 $331,595.64 $601.81 2 Cascade Hardwood, LLC 
 95135 CAT FAN SORT 10 303 $790.00 $957.55 $162,319.21 $213,086.86 $703.26 2 Cascade Hardwood, LLC 
 95136 CAT FAN SORT 11 254 $1,200.00 $1,530.00 $226,160.83 $309,980.83 $1,220.40 2 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 95137 CAT FAN SORT 12 4 $364.00 $494.00 $150.19 $670.19 $167.55 2 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 95138 CAT FAN SORT 13 28 $338.00 $520.00 $323.32 $5,419.32 $193.55 2 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 95139 CAT FAN SORT 14 113 $325.00 $546.00 $1,260.74 $26,233.74 $232.16 3 Cascade Hardwood, LLC 
 96360 JUG BAND SORT 01 786 $735.00 $797.00 $401,982.16 $450,714.16 $573.43 2 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 96361 JUG BAND SORT 02 1,141 $650.00 0 NO BIDS 
 96362 JUG BAND SORT 03 1,630 $675.00 $845.60 $761,923.43 $1,040,001.43 $638.04 3 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 96363 JUG BAND SORT 04 503 $650.00 $831.58 $214,724.51 $306,059.25 $608.47 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 96364 JUG BAND SORT 05 381 $510.00 $712.00 $113,590.46 $190,552.46 $500.14 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 96365 JUG BAND SORT 06 219 $470.00 $712.00 $54,948.78 $107,946.78 $492.91 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 96366 JUG BAND SORT 07 412 $1,200.00 $1,500.00 $337,645.41 $461,245.41 $1,119.53 3 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 96367 JUG BAND SORT 08 158 $950.00 $1,279.00 $88,711.89 $140,693.89 $890.47 2 McFarland Cascade Holdings, Inc. 
 96368 JUG BAND SORT 09 138 $625.36 $682.75 $55,113.52 $63,033.52 $456.76 1 Washington Alder, LLC. 
 96369 JUG BAND SORT 10 67 $243.00 $252.00 ($66,438.03) ($65,835.03) ($982.61) 1 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 96370 JUG BAND SORT 11 46 $270.00 0 NO BIDS  


