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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 August 2017 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 93650 LITTLE FOOT Clallam OLY 6397 $1,238,000.00 $2,238,542.00 $349.94 81% 3.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 94685 WAY OUT Pacific PC 3756 $678,000.00 $1,008,959.00 $268.63 49% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 95125 CAT FAN SORTS Pacific PC 221 $51,637.04 $74,052.88 $335.08 43% 2.33 See Sort Sales Results 
 95063 FRIAR TUCK Skagit NW 2584 $791,000.00 $1,220,872.00 $472.47 54% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

August 2017 4 4 0 0 12,958 12,958 0 0 100% $2,758,637.04 $4,542,425.88 $350.55 65% 2.33 
YTD FY 2018 9 9 0 0 22,888 22,888 0 0 100% $4,739,562.04 $7,066,883.34 $308.76 49% 2.37   

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

August 2017 4 4 0 0 12,958 12,958 0 0 100% $2,758,637.04 $4,542,425.88 $350.55 65% 2.33 
YTD FY 2018 9 9 0 0 22,888 22,888 0 0 100% $4,739,562.04 $7,066,883.34 $308.76 49% 2.37  
  

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 95243 CARROL FLATS FIT SORT 1 1,906 $560.00 $685.49 $260,618.07 $499,802.01 $262.23 5 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 95245 CARROL FLATS FIT SORT 3 229 $350.00 $614.20 ($12,214.54) $48,287.26 $210.86 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 95246 CARROL FLATS FIT SORT 4 85 $400.00 $614.20 ($4,483.65) $13,723.35 $161.45 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 95247 CARROL FLATS FIT SORT 5 450 $216.00 $306.00 ($95,246.49) ($54,746.49) ($121.66) 1 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 96034 CAT FAN SORT 15 22 $620.00 $760.50 $6,726.43 $9,817.43 $446.25 3 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 96035 CAT FAN SORT 16 40 $560.00 $660.00 $10,895.08 $14,895.08 $372.38 1 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 96036 CAT FAN SORT 17 57 $540.00 $680.00 $14,208.79 $22,188.79 $389.28 4 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 96037 CAT FAN SORT 18 43 $450.00 $535.00 $3,632.51 $7,287.51 $169.48 3 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 96038 CAT FAN SORT 19 31 $475.00 $475.00 $5,950.67 $5,950.67 $191.96 1 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc. 
 96039 CAT FAN SORT 20 28 $625.00 $756.78 $10,223.56 $13,913.40 $496.91 2 Cascade Hardwood, LLC 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS 
 August 2017 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    TREATMENT  VOLUME TOTAL     
 NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION ACRES OFFERED MINIMUM  TOTAL BID PRICETOTAL REVENUE NET $ / MBF 
  MBF BID 

 CARROL FLATS FIT Yakima SE 893 2,670 $1,278,710.00 $1,637,102.74 $507,066.13 $189.91 
 PROJECTS  PROJECTS  NOT  TREATMENT  VOLUME  VOLUME  
 OFFERED AWARDED AWARDED ACRES OFFERED AWARDED 

August 2017 1 1 0 893 2,670 2,670 
YTD FY 2018 2 2 0 2,039 5,397 5,397 

 


