AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY

101392 BBQ HEAT LOW Grays Harbor
102406 Q CASSNER CREEK ' Stevens
102451 Q SOUTH JUMBO Stevens
SORTS
SALES SALES  SALES SALES
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID
April 2022 3 3 0 0
YTD FY 2022 70 68 0 2
AGREEMENT FSC® NAME OF SALE COUNTY
102915 STRIPED FLY Clallam
SALES  SALES  SALES SALES
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID
April 2022 1 1 0 0
YTD FY 2022 12 11 0 1
SALES  SALES  SALES SALES
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID
April 2022 4 4 0 0
YTD FY 2022 82 79 0 3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

BOARD SALE RESULTS
April 2022
VOLUME
REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
PC 5400 $1,739,000.00 $2,577,668.04 $477.35 48% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
NE 4832 $1,123,000.00 $1,389,970.85 $287.66 24% 3.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
NE 3350 $851,451.30 $1,190,926.90 $355.50 40% 2.60 See Sort Sales Results
SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES
VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS
13,582 13,582 0 0 100% $3,713,451.30 $5,158,565.79 $379.81 39% 2.53
311,227 306,070 0 5,157 98% $100,305,851.22 $136,473,379.63 $445.89 36% 2.92
REGIONAL SALE RESULTS
VOLUME
REGION  OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
OLY 469 $114,000.00 $115,000.00 $245.20 1% 1.00  Bekkevar Logging and Trucking Inc.
SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES
VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS
469 469 0 0 100% $114,000.00 $115,000.00 $245.20 1% 1.00
19,393 17,519 0 1,874 90% $966,210.00 $1,815,436.90 $103.63 88% 1.91
SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES
VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS
14,051 14,051 0 0 100% $3,827,451.30 $5,273,565.79 $375.32 38% 2.15
330,620 323,589 0 7,031 98% $101,272,061.22 $138,288,816.53 $427.36 37% 2.78

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)



AGREE-
MENT

103021

103022

103023

103024

103025

FSC

NAME OF SALE

Q SOUTH JUMBO SORT 01
DF/WL 7-10" dib

Q SOUTH JUMBO SORT 02
DF/WL 11"+ dib

Q SOUTH JUMBO SORT 03
WRC 5"+ dib

Q SOUTH JUMBO SORT 04
DF/WL 5-6"dib

Q SOUTH JUMBO SORT 05

VOLUME
OFFERED
MBF

1,060

1,264

335
616

75

All conifer species except WRC 2"+

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)

Delivered Values

MINIMUM
BID / MBF

$498.00

$500.00

$1,232.00
$332.77

$198.00

Stumpage Determination (Projected)

April 2022
TOTAL
BID MINIMUM
PRICE / MBF BID
$584.10 $210,547.26
$598.25 $307,492.63
$1,592.80 $336,479.86
$337.89 $345.59
$198.00 ($3,414.04)

TOTAL BID

PRICE
$301,813.26

$431,680.63

$457,347.86
$3,499.19

($3,414.04)

PRICE

/MBF
$284.73

$341.52

$1,365.22
$5.68

($45.52)

# OF
BIDS

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

Boise Cascade Wood Products,
LLC

Boise Cascade Wood Products,
LLC

Columbia Cedar, Inc.
Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.

Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.



