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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 April 2014 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 88503 NORTH BELL  Clark PC 6019 $1,767,000.00 $2,107,445.52 $350.13 19% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 MOUNTAIN 
 90410 NORTH COLVIN  Cowlitz PC 4315 $1,936,805.70 Project Pending - See Sort Sales  
 SORTS Results 
 90248 RAINBOW ROCK Jefferson Ol 1297 $352,000.00 $706,002.00 $544.33 101% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 90287 INTERROREM Jefferson Ol 3592 $1,018,000.00 $1,665,474.00 $463.66 64% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 90599 GOODMINT Jefferson,  Ol 4222 $1,149,000.00 $1,420,411.00 $336.43 24% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 Clallam 
 90575 STORM CAT  Lewis PC 10426 $3,922,944.55 $4,147,727.10 $397.83 6% 3.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 89281 PUSHUP Mason SP 2102 $674,000.00 $1,002,330.35 $476.85 49% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 90269 BURT NORTH VRH Pacific PC 4415 $1,390,000.00 $1,562,196.13 $353.84 12% 2.00 Murphy Company 
 89912 LADY CAROLINE  Skagit NW 4975 $2,429,165.68 Project Pending - See Sort Sales  
 SORTS Results 
 90352 DELPHINUS Skagit NW 3511 $1,368,000.00 $1,435,328.00 $408.81 5% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 90314 HARDSCRAMBLE  Skamania PC 3083 $532,000.00 $858,962.55 $278.61 61% 3.00 High Cascade, Inc. 
 VRH 
 86841 GRAYS POINT Wahkiakum PC 2994 $800,000.00 $1,334,832.55 $445.84 67% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 88972 RACEHORSE RIDGE Whatcom NW 3986 $1,073,000.00 $1,345,489.14 $337.55 25% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 

 
SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

April 2014 13 11 2 0 54,937 45,647 7,375 1,915 83% $14,045,944.55 $17,586,198.34 $385.27 25% 2.18 
YTD FY 2014 88 86 2 0 352,452 343,158 7,375 1,919 97% $82,425,698.42 $128,286,318.27 $373.84 56% 3.20 
  

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

None Offered 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

YTD FY 2014 15 13 0 2 17,828 16,053 0 1,775 90% $1,649,489.32 $3,045,732.98 $189.73 85% 2.24 
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

April 2014 13 11 2 0 54,937 45,647 7,375 1,915 83% $14,045,944.55 $17,586,198.34 $385.27 25% 2.18 
YTD FY 2014 103 99 2 2 370,280 359,211 7,375 3,694 97% $84,075,187.74 $131,332,051.25 $365.61 56% 3.07 



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 April 2014 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 89841 WINDY JIM FIT SORT 01 189 $420.00 $432.00 $12,295.86 $14,563.86 $77.06 3 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 89842 WINDY JIM FIT SORT 02 48 $375.00 $440.00 $2,924.41 $6,044.41 $125.93 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 89843 WINDY JIM FIT SORT 03 254 $403.05 $403.05 $9,505.49 $9,505.49 $37.42 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 89844 WINDY JIM FIT SORT 04 41 $342.44 $2,319.65 0 NO BIDS 
 89845 WINDY JIM FIT SORT 05 162 $792.22 $794.95 $82,626.28 $83,068.34 $512.77 1 Columbia Cedar, Inc. 
 89846 WINDY JIM FIT SORT 06 2,232 $320.00 $320.00 ($125,505.14) ($125,505.14) ($56.23) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 89847 WINDY JIM FIT SORT 07 441 $225.00 $225.00 ($127,711.63) ($127,711.63) ($289.60) 2 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 90411 NORTH COLVIN SORT 1 166 $573.92 $574.90 $51,704.69 $51,868.01 $312.46 3 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 90412 NORTH COLVIN SORT 2 405 $650.00 $650.00 $150,943.90 $150,943.90 $372.70 3 Simpson Lumber Co., LLC 
 90413 NORTH COLVIN SORT 3 1,441 $675.00 $675.00 $587,747.09 $587,742.09 $407.87 2 Simpson Lumber Co., LLC 
 90414 NORTH COLVIN SORT 4 1,165 $600.00 $699,000.00 0 NO BIDS 
 90415 NORTH COLVIN SORT 5 1,032 $700.00 $700.00 $443,152.14 $443,152.14 $429.41 2 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 90416 NORTH COLVIN SORT 6 39 $496.92                                          $19,379.88 0 NO BIDS 
 90417 NORTH COLVIN SORT 7 64 $252.03 $256.50 $4,063.50 $4,349.50 $67.96 2 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 90418 NORTH COLVIN SORT 8 3 $253.33 $256.50 $194.38 $203.88 $67.96 2 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 90576 STORM CAT SORT 1 426 $573.97 $573.97 $169,541.90 $169,541.90 $397.99 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 90577 STORM CAT SORT 2 966 $650.00 $650.00 $374,836.98 $374,836.98 $388.03 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 90578 STORM CAT SORT 3 3,156 $675.00 $675.00 $1,239,329.64 $1,239,329.64 $392.69 2 Simpson Lumber Co., LLC 
 90579 STORM CAT SORT 4 1,576 $600.00 $601.00 $531,600.56 $533,176.56 $338.31 1 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 90580 STORM CAT SORT 5 1,980 $700.00 $700.00 $847,737.00 $847,737.00 $428.15 3 Murphy Company 
 90581 STORM CAT SORT 6 848 $700.00 $789.00 $330,100.96 $405,572.96 $478.27 3 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 90582 STORM CAT SORT 7 174 $467.53 $467.50 $49,777.70 $49,772.70 $286.05 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 90583 STORM CAT SORT 8 238 $525.00 $610.00 $50,301.30 $70,531.30 $296.35 5 Rainier Veneer, Inc. 
 90584 STORM CAT SORT 9 463 $550.00 $588.10 $116,509.32 $134,149.62 $289.74 3 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 90585 STORM CAT SORT 10 173 $1,000.00 $1,330.00 $123,862.81 $180,952.81 $1,045.97 5 Butteville Lumber 
 90586 STORM CAT SORT 11 301 $520.20 $694.69 $76,026.38 $128,546.88 $427.07 2 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 90587 STORM CAT SORT 12 115 $252.00 $254.25 $12,254.40 $12,513.15 $108.81 3 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 90588 STORM CAT SORT 13 10 $252.00 $252.00 $1,065.60 $1,065.60 $106.56 3 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 90976 LADY CAROLINE SORT 01 526 $700.00 $725.00 $257,742.96 $270,892.96 $515.01 3 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 90977 LADY CAROLINE SORT 02 1,107 $750.00 $836.00 $602,369.21 $697,571.21 $630.15 2 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 90978 LADY CAROLINE SORT 03 323 $625.00 $201,875.00 0 NO BIDS 
 90979 LADY CAROLINE SORT 04 903 $650.00 $655.00 $410,915.24 $415,430.24 $460.06 1 Great Western Lumber Co. 
 90980 LADY CAROLINE SORT 05 947 $625.00 $660.00 $412,670.05 $445,815.05 $470.77 2 Great Western Lumber Co. 
 90981 LADY CAROLINE SORT 06 331 $575.00 $190,325.00 0 NO BIDS 
 90982 LADY CAROLINE SORT 07 57 $510.88 $29,120.00 0 NO BIDS 
 90983 LADY CAROLINE SORT 08 201 $700.00 $701.00 $104,185.46 $104,386.46 $519.34 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 90984 LADY CAROLINE SORT 09 177 $725.00 $865.00 $72,751.54 $97,531.54 $551.03 2 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 90985 LADY CAROLINE SORT 10 23 $400.00 $440.00 $4,883.26 $5,803.26 $252.32 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 90986 LADY CAROLINE SORT 11 166 $1,000.00 $1,250.00 $137,591.69 $179,091.69 $1,078.87 3 Marys River Lumber Co. 
 90987 LADY CAROLINE SORT 12 120 $225.00 $225.00 $2,010.68 $2,010.68 $16.76 1 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 90988 LADY CAROLINE SORT 13 94 $198.00 $198.00 $2,725.59 $2,725.59 $29.00 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS 
 April 2014 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    TREATMENT VOLUME TOTAL     
 NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION  ACRES OFFERED MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  TOTAL REVENUE NET $ / MBF 
  MBF BID PRICE 

WINDY JIM FIT SORTS     Pend Oreille,  Northeast      616           3,367 $1,155,610      Project Pending – See Sort Sales Results 
      Stevens 

 PROJECTS  PROJECTS  NOT AWARDED TREATMENT  VOLUME  VOLUME  
 OFFERED AWARDED  ACRES OFFERED AWARDED 
April 2014 1 0 0  616 3,367    0 
YTD FY 2014 3 2 0  1,995 6,347  6,347 


